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Bid Tabulation -
Water Supplies Bass & Hays Core & Main Ferguson Waterworks BlllJJe?B.Aook APSCO W';?;:J\:kas
RFB # 19104
Grand Prairie, TX Dallas, TX Euless, TX Waukegan, IL| Kaufman, TX Dallas, TX
Description UOM Price Price Notes Price Notes Price Nonresponsive | Nonresponsive

Water Sampling Stations & Replacement Parts

Water Sampling Stations [ Total | ] [Nonresponsive___Incompatable | $3386175 ] [ |

Water Meter Boxes & Lids

Water Meter Boxes & Lids 87898 | | | | |

Fire Hydrant & Valve Parts

Amount based
on estimated
annual quantities

Amount based on estimated
annual spending for the listed
brands of fire hydrant and valve
parts.

Amount based on estimated annual
spending for listed brand fire hydrant
and valve parts, and water warehouse

stock.

Amount based
on estimated
annual
quantities

USP, including collision kits Total $3,536.66 Primary $3,727.44 Secondary
Waterous, including collision kits Total $5,376.35 Secondary $4,651.89 Primary
Clow, including collision kits Total $3,281.40

Mueller, including collision kits Total $6,869.48 Primary $7,753.93 Secondary
Kennedy, including collision kits Total $1,630.63

M&H, including collision kits Total $1,287.72

Fire Hydrant Qil Gallon $37.00 Primary $46.45 Secondary
% Discount for items not listed % -5.00% -15.00%

Water Warehouse Stock

Fittings Total $ 6,008.51 $ 5,922.45

Water Pipe Total $ 74.00 $ 71.39

Sewer Pipe Total $ 30.02 $ 29.91

Sewer Parts Total $ 1,793.22 $ 1,742.20

Cast Iron Fittings Total $23,372.14 $ 22,485.90

% Discount for items not listed % -5.00% -30.00%

Fire Hydrants & Water Valves - not awarding this section at this time

Fire Hydrants & Water Valves | Total | | $289,603.00 $289,965.50

SPLIT AWARD $190,000.00 $30,000.00 $310,000.00 $33,861.75 [Non-Responsive |Non-Responsive




RFB# 19104 - Water Supplies
Bid Evaluation

Ferguson's bid for Kupferle products is nonresponsive. Kupferle products are not compatible with our existing water sampling stations

Core & Main and Bass & Hays returned "No Bid" for this section
APSCO & Fortiline, Inc. were nonresponsive for entire bid

Water Sampling Stations USA BlueBook Ferguson Waterworks
Item Description (0137 uom Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer # Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer #
3/4" Stations
1 Sampling Stations 25 EACH $404.95 $10,123.75 1500-5834-NL $330.00 $8,250.00 Kupferle 95WM
2 Housing Caps 20 EACH $26.92 $538.40 CAP-1500 $6.63 $132.50 Kupferle 95WM
3 Main Sampling Valves 20 EACH $47.38 $947.60 1500-MV-NL $51.25 $1,025.00 Kupferle 95WM
4 Sampling Rods 150G 15 EACH $237.10 $3,556.50 150G-NL $258.43 $3,876.45 Kupferle 95WM
5 |Sampling Rod Housing Caps 20 EACH $19.48 $389.60 END-150G $5.35 $107.00 Kupferle 95WM
6 |Sampling Rod Valve Key 20 EACH $30.64 $612.80 150G-QCE-SS Sold Complete
7  |Sampling Rod Housing 20 EACH $109.74 $2,194.80 CAS150 -Probe Rod Case Sold Complete
8  [Sampling Rod Pressure Gauge 20 EACH $24.13 $482.60 PG150-NL Sold Complete
9 Sampling Rod Glove Valve 20 EACH $16.00 $320.00 SAMPLING ROD BALL VALVE Sold Complete
10 [Sampling Rod Upper Rod 20 EACH $25.99 $519.80 SPOUT-150G Sold Complete
1" Stations
11 |Sampling Stations 12 EACH $634.45 $7,613.40 1500-1034A-NL $470.00 $5,640.00 Kupferle 95WM
12 [Housing Caps 10 EACH $26.92 $269.20 CAP-1500 $6.63 $66.30 Kupferle 95WM
13 |Main Sampling Valves 10 EACH $47.38 $473.80 1500-MV-NL $51.25 $512.50 Kupferle 95WM
14 Sampling Rods 150G 7 EACH $237.10 $1,659.70 150G-NL $258.43 $1,809.01 Kupferle 95WM
15 |Sampling Rod Housing Caps 10 EACH $19.48 $194.80 END-150G $5.35 $53.50 Kupferle 95WM
16 [Sampling Rod Valve Key 10 EACH $30.64 $306.40 150G-QCE-SS Sold Complete
17 [Sampling Rod Housing 10 EACH $109.74 $1,097.40 CAS150 -Probe Rod Case Sold Complete
18 |Sampling Rod Pressure Gauge 10 EACH $24.13 $241.30 PG150-NL Sold Complete
19 [Sampling Rod Glove Valve 10 EACH $16.00 $160.00 SAMPLING ROD BALL VALVE Sold Complete
20 [Sampling Rod Upper Rod 10 EACH $25.99 $259.90 SPOUT-150G Sold Complete
Percentage Discount
21 [for Items not $2,000.00 % ($0.05) $1,900.00 ($0.10) $1,800.00
Total $33,861.75 $23,272.26
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RFB# 19104 - Water Supplies
Bid Evaluation
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Core & Main, Ferguson Waterworks, and USA BlueBook returned "No Bid" for this section
APSCO & Fortiline, Inc. were non-responsive for entire bid

Water Meter Boxes & Lids - Bid tab quantities

Bass & Hays

Description Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer #

22 18 x 18 Residential Rated Box Complete Set 12 EACH $77.25 $927.00 P34P18D1S W/3LIDP-7
23 [18 x 18 Residential Rated Box —Lid Only w/slide in slot 10 EACH $16.80 $168.00 3LIDP-2
24 |18 x 18 Residential Rated Box —Lid Only w/o slide in slot 10 EACH $16.80 $168.00 3LIDP-7
25 |28 x 18 Residential Rated Box CompleteSet 7 EACH $224.54 $1,571.78 P55P18D W/5LIDP-7
26 |28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only w/slide in slot 10 EACH $44.29 $442.90 SLIDP-2
27 |28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only w/o slide in slot 10 EACH $44.29 $442.90 SLIDP-7
28 (28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only (Import) w/slide in slot 10 EACH N/A
29 (28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only (Import) w/o slide in slot 10 EACH N/A
30 |28 x 18 Texas Special Residential Rated Box Complete Set 10 EACH $191.58 $1,915.80 P55P18 W/5LIDP-7
31 18 x 18 Traffic Rated Box Complete Set 10 EACH $113.26 $1,132.60 P34PD18 W/3LID9
32 [Percentage Discount for Items not Specified (Example for 5%: $2,000 % $2,000.00

Total $8,768.98

Water Meter Boxes & Lids - Annual Estimated Quantities Bass & Hays

Description Unit Price Extended Price Manufacturer #

22 18 x 18 Residential Rated Box Complete Set 600 EACH $77.25 $46,350.00 P34P18D1S W/3LIDP-7
23 [18 x 18 Residential Rated Box —Lid Only w/slide in slot 3000 EACH $16.80 $50,400.00 3LIDP-2
24 |18 x 18 Residential Rated Box —Lid Only w/o slide in slot 3000 EACH $16.80 $50,400.00 3LIDP-7
25 |28 x 18 Residential Rated Box CompleteSet 100 EACH $224.54 $22,454.00 P55P18D W/5LIDP-7
26 |28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only w/slide in slot 50 EACH $44.29 $2,214.50 SLIDP-2
27 |28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only w/o slide in slot 50 EACH $44.29 $2,214.50 SLIDP-7
28 (28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only (Import) w/slide in slot 50 EACH N/A
29 (28 x 18 Residential Rated Box Lid Only (Import) w/o slide in slot 50 EACH N/A
30 |28 x 18 Texas Special Residential Rated Box Complete Set 50 EACH $191.58 $9,579.00 P55P18 W/5LIDP-7
31 18 x 18 Traffic Rated Box Complete Set 50 EACH $113.26 $5,663.00 P34PD18 W/3LID9
32 [Percentage Discount for Items not Specified (Example for 5%: $2,000 % $2,000.00

Total $191,275.00
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RFB# 19104 - Water Supplies Bass & Hays and USA Bluebook returned "No Bid" for this section
Bid Evaluation APSCO & Fortiline, Inc. were non-responsive for the entire bid
Fire Hydrant & Valve Parts Core & Main Ferguson Waterworks
Description Unit Price Manufacturer # Unit Price Manufacturer #
usp
74  [#10 BONNETT SEAL USP F.H. 1 EACH $16.65 MUELLER $8.33 US Pipe
75 |#12 BONNET REVOLVING NUT O-RING USP F.H. 1 EACH $3.80 MUELLER $3.80 US Pipe
76  |#13 REVOLVING NUT W/#14 O-RINGS USP F.H. 1 EACH $190.55 MUELLER $190.55 US Pipe
77  |#14INNER REVOLVING NUT O-RING USP F.H. 1 EACH $4.09 MUELLER $4.09 US Pipe
78  [#26 VALVE ROD COUPLING USP F.H. 1 EACH $60.50 MUELLER $60.50 US Pipe
79  |#27 COUPLING RETAINING RINGS USP F.H. 1 EACH $5.36 MUELLER $5.36 US Pipe
80 [#28 ROD COUPLING PIN USP F.H. 1 EACH $6.75 MUELLER $6.75 US Pipe
81 [#29 STAND PIPE COUPLING SEAL USP F.H. 1 EACH $22.66 MUELLER $30.00 US Pipe
82  [#30 STAND PIPE COUPLING USP F.H. 1 EACH $175.75 MUELLER $163.08 US Pipe
83  [#31 NUTS AND BOLTS USP F.H. 1 EACH $7.63 MUELLER $5.00 US Pipe
84  [#34 TOP PLATE PIN USP F.H. 1 EACH $7.69 MUELLER $7.69 US Pipe
85  [#35 VALVE TOP PLATE USP F.H. 1 EACH $240.50 MUELLER $240.50 US Pipe
86 [#36 VALVE ROD LOWER O-RING USP F.H. 1 EACH $4.09 MUELLER $4.00 US Pipe
87  [#39 DRAIN VALVE FACING USP F.H. 1 EACH $17.59 MUELLER $8.34 US Pipe
88  [#40 GUIDE PLATE USP F.H. 1 EACH $18.31 MUELLER $50.00 US Pipe
89  [#41 DRAIN VALVE FACING SCREWS USP F.H. 1 EACH $1.84 MUELLER $6.00 US Pipe
90  [#42 SEAT RINGS USP F.H. 1 EACH $254.16 MUELLER $276.58 US Pipe
91 [#44 MAIN VALVES FOR USP F.H. 1 EACH $66.66 MUELLER $66.79 US Pipe
92  |#45 VALVE BOTTOM PLATE USP F.H. 1 EACH $64.16 MUELLER $65.69 US Pipe
93  [#47 ANTI-FRICTION BEARING USP FIRE HYDRANT 1 EACH $7.09 MUELLER $7.86 US Pipe
94 |24 INCH USP FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $387.50 MUELLER $656.12 US Pipe
95 |24 UPPER VALVE ROD USP F.H. 1 EACH $225.70 MUELLER $225.70 US Pipe
96 [12 INCH USP FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $569.79 MUELLER $508.12 US Pipe
97 |6 INCH USP FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $482.84 MUELLER $429.19 US Pipe
98 |BONNETTKIT 1 EACH $65.00 MUELLER $70.41 US Pipe
99  |MAIN VALVE KIT 1 EACH $400.00 MUELLER $406.99 US Pipe
243 |US PIPE COLLISION KIT 1 EACH $230.00 MUELLER $220.00 US Pipe
Total USP $3,536.66 $3,727.44

Waterous
100 |[#101 WEATHER SHIELD WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $159.60 WATEROUS $141.87 American Flow Control
101 [#102 GROVED PIN WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $7.60 WATEROUS $7.60 American Flow Control
102 [#12 VALVE STEM 6 INCH WATEROUS VALVE 1 EACH $172.90 WATEROUS $153.69 American Flow Control
103 [#17 OPERATING NUTS WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $161.50 WATEROUS $323.42 American Flow Control
104 [#3 VALVE SEAT O-RING PACKING WATEROUS PACER 1 EACH $7.60 WATEROUS $7.60 American Flow Control
105 [#30 CROSSARM WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $131.10 WATEROUS $116.53 American Flow Control
106 |#34 UPPER VALVE WASHER WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $51.30 WATEROUS $153.69 American Flow Control
107 [#35 MAIN VALVE RUBBER WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $76.00 WATEROUS $67.56 American Flow Control
108 [#36 LOWER VALVE WASHER WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $101.65 WATEROUS $90.36 American Flow Control
109 |[#4 THRUST WASHER 6 INCH WATEROUS VALVE 1 EACH $2.85 WATEROUS $2.85 American Flow Control
110 |#4 THRUST WASHER 8 INCH WATEROUS VALVE 1 EACH $2.85 WATEROUS $2.85 American Flow Control
111 [#5 STUFFING BOX GASKET 6 INCH WATEROUS VALVE 1 EACH $2.85 WATEROUS $2.85 American Flow Control
112 [#5 STUFFING BOX GASKET 8 INCH WATEROUS VALVE 1 EACH $2.85 WATEROUS $27.55 American Flow Control
113 [#6 STUFFING BOX BOLT AND #15 NUT 6 INCH WAT 1 EACH $13.30 WATEROUS $14.52 American Flow Control
114 [#62 LOCK RING CLAMP WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $11.40 WATEROUS $11.40 American Flow Control
115 |[#63 STAND PIPE FLANGES LOWER FOR WATEROUS HYDRANT 1 EACH $110.20 WATEROUS $97.96 American Flow Control
116 |#64 RING STAND PIPE WATEROUS FH 1 EACH $19.00 WATEROUS $19.00 American Flow Control
117 [#6A BONNET BOLTS 1 EACH $7.60 WATEROUS $7.60 American Flow Control
118 |[#6B SAFETY FLANGE BOLT WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $7.60 WATEROUS $7.60 American Flow Control
119 [#6C SAFETY FLANGE AND BONNET NUTS WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $2.85 WATEROUS $2.85 American Flow Control
120 |[#7 DRAIN PLUNGER WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $37.05 WATEROUS $37.05 American Flow Control
121 [#7 PACKING GLAND 6 INCH WATEROUS VALVE 1 EACH $133.00 WATEROUS $28.50 American Flow Control
122 [#7 PACKING GLANDS WATEROUS VALVES 1 EACH $133.00 WATEROUS $28.50 American Flow Control
123 [#77 VALVE SEAT O-RING PACKING WATEROUS PACER 1 EACH $11.40 WATEROUS $11.40 American Flow Control
124 [#8 COTTER PIN WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $5.70 WATEROUS $7.60 American Flow Control
125 |[#84 SUPPORT GASKET WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $11.40 WATEROUS $11.40 American Flow Control
126 [#87 SELF LOCKING NUT 1 EACH $4.75 WATEROUS $4.75 American Flow Control
127 [#88 STUDS WATEROUS F.H. 1 EACH $10.45 WATEROUS $10.45 American Flow Control
128 [#90 THURST RINGS WATEROUS F.H 1 EACH $7.60 WATEROUS $8.00 American Flow Control
129 [#92 STAND PIPE GASKETS 1 EACH $11.40 WATEROUS $11.40 American Flow Control
130 [113 STAND PIPE FLANGES UPPER; FOR WATEROUS HYDRANT 1 EACH $61.75 WATEROUS $54.89 American Flow Control
131 [12 INCH WATEROUS FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $731.50 WATEROUS $209.33 American Flow Control
132 |18 INCH WATEROUS FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $849.30 WATEROUS $243.04 American Flow Control
133 [6 INCH WATEROUS FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $621.30 WATEROUS $177.80 American Flow Control
134 |67 SAFETY STEM COUPLING HALFS WATERTOUS F.H. 1 EACH $33.25 WATEROUS $33.25 American Flow Control
135 |67 SOLID STEM COUPLING HALFS WATEROUS HYDRANT 1 EACH $41.80 WATEROUS $32.18 American Flow Control
136 |WATERROUS OPERATING NUTS 4 INCH -12 1 EACH $41.80 WATEROUS $163.82 American Flow Control
137 |71 WATEROUS PACER UPPER ROD ASSEMBLY 1 EACH $184.30 WATEROUS $387.60 American Flow Control
138 |#31 VALVE SEAT W/UPPER AND LOWER ORING 1 EACH $436.05 WATEROUS $379.17 American Flow Control
139 |BONNETTKIT 1 EACH $45.60 WATEROUS $725.00 American Flow Control
140 [MAIN VALVE KIT 1 EACH $791.35 WATEROUS $725.00 American Flow Control
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RFB# 19104 - Water Supplies
Bid Evaluation

Bass & Hays and USA Bluebook returned "No Bid" for this section
APSCO & Fortiline, Inc. were non-responsive for the entire bid

Fire Hydrant & Valve Parts

Ferguson Waterworks

Description Unit Price Manufacturer # Unit Price Manufacturer #
Waterous (continued)
239 |WATEROUS MEDALLION COLLISION KIT 1 | EACH $120.00 WATEROUS $102.41 American Flow Control
Total Waterous $5,376.35 $4,651.89
Clow
141 |M-15 DRAIN VALVE FACING SCREWS FOR CLOW MEDILLION F.H. 1 EACH $0.83 CLOW
142 |M-16 DRAIN VALVE FACING CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $7.43 CLOW
143 |M-17 UPPER VALVE PLATE FOR CLOW MEDILLION F.H. 1 EACH $212.85 CLOW
144 |M-18 SEAT RING UPPER O-RING CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $9.90 CLOW
145 |M-19 SEAT RING CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $384.45 CLOW
146 |M-20 SEAT RING LOWER O-RING CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $6.60 CLOW
147 |M-21 MAIN VALVE CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $65.18 CLOW
148 |M-22 LOWER VALVE PLATE LOCKWASHER 1 EACH $2.48 CLOW
149 |M-24 LOWER VALVE PLATE CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $169.95 CLOW
150 |M-3 CLOW OPERATING NUT CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $141.08 CLOW
151 |M-32 BONNET ORING CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $3.30 CLOW
152 |M-7 CLOW MEDILLION UPPER STEM 1 EACH $161.70 CLOW
153 |M 49 CLOW SAFETY FLANGE CLOW HYDRANT 1 EACH $59.40 CLOW
154 |CLOW MEDALLION FIRE HYDRANT LUBRICANT 1 EACH $25.00 CLOW
155 |R-56 INCH FOLLOWER PLATE CLOW VALVE 1 EACH $45.38 CLOW
156 |R-6 6 INCH STEM ORING CLOW VALVE 1 EACH $5.78 CLOW
157 |R-7 6 INCH FOLLOWER PLATE ORING CLOW VALVE 1 EACH $5.78 CLOW
158 |R-8 6 INCH THRUST WASHER CLOW VALVE 1 EACH $2.48 CLOW
159 |R-9 6 INCH STEM CLOW VALVE 1 EACH $315.15 CLOW
160 |6 INCH CLOW FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION MEDAL 1 EACH $487.94 CLOW
161 |12 INCH CLOW FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION MEDA 1 EACH $569.78 CLOW
162 |BONNETT KIT 1 EACH $65.00 CLOW
163 |MAIN VALVE KIT 1 EACH $303.96 CLOW
245 |CLOW MEDALLION HYDRANT COLLISON KIT 1 EACH $230.00 CLOW No Bid
Total Clow $3,281.40
Mueller
164 |A-1 OPERATING NUT MUELLER F.H. 1 EACH $178.75 MUELLER $158.89 Mueller|
165 |A-5 BONNET ORING 1 EACH $7.04 MUELLER $7.04 Mueller|
166 |A-6 ANTI FRICTION WASHER MUELLER 1 EACH $2.09 MUELLER $2.09 Mueller|
167 |A-9 BONNET BOLTS AND NUTS MUELLER 1 EACH $7.91 MUELLER $7.91 Mueller|
168 |A-10 BONNET GASKET MUELLER F.H. 1 EACH $15.06 MUELLER $12.09 Mueller|
169 |A-111975-1976 UPPER STEM CENTURION F.HYD 1 EACH $158.33 MUELLER $140.73 Mueller|
170 |A-13 NOZZEL LOCK MUELLER 1 EACH $0.66 MUELLER $0.76 Mueller|
171 [A1821/2 INCH HOSE NOZZEL CENT.F.H. 1 EACH $64.54 MUELLER $64.54 Mueller|
172 |A-36 UPPER VALVE PLATE MUELLER F.H. 1 EACH $171.55 MUELLER $152.49 Mueller|
173 |A39 AND A44 TOP AND BOTTOM SEAT RING O-RING 1 EACH $14.08 MUELLER $17.35 Mueller|
174 |A-43 SEAT RING MUELLER F.H. 1 EACH $248.60 MUELLER $220.98 Mueller|
175 |A-47 CAP NUT SEAL MUELLER 1 EACH $1.41 MUELLER $1.41 Mueller|
176 |A-49 CAP NUT MUELLER 1 EACH $15.89 MUELLER $15.89 Mueller|
177 |A-84 HOLD DOWN NUT MUELLER 1 EACH $56.79 MUELLER $50.48 Mueller|
178 |A-85 WEATHER SEAL MUELLER 1 EACH $3.86 MUELLER $3.86 Mueller|
179 |H51 OPERATING NUT MUELLER 1 EACH $178.75 MUELLER $158.89 Mueller|
180 [H52/A2 WEATHER CAP MUELLER 1 EACH $28.61 MUELLER $28.61 Mueller|
181 [H53/A4 HOLD DOWN NUT MUELLER 1 EACH $56.79 MUELLER $56.79 Mueller|
182 |H-59 BONNET GASKET MUELLER F.H. 1 EACH $15.06 MUELLER $15.06 Mueller|
183 [H67 / A17 MUELLER PUMPER NOZZLE CAP 1 EACH $156.55 MUELLER $139.16 Mueller|
184 [H-68/A15 PUMPER NOZZEL GASKET MUELLER 1 EACH $11.64 MUELLER $11.64 Mueller|
185 [H-72/A-19 HOSE NOZZEL GASKET MUELLER 1 EACH $3.85 MUELLER $3.85 Mueller|
186 |H-74 UPPER STEM IMPROVED OLD STYLE F.H. 1 EACH $165.58 MUELLER $147.18 Mueller|
187 |H-75 SAFETY STEM COUPLING MUELLER 1 EACH $99.78 MUELLER $88.69 Mueller|
188 |H76/A27 SAFETY FLANGE GASKET MUELLER 1 EACH $15.06 MUELLER $12.09 Mueller|
189 [H-77/A-28 SAFETY FLANGE MUELLER 1 EACH $75.20 MUELLER $66.84 Mueller|
190 [H-78/H65 BONNET / FLANGE BOLT AND NUT 1 EACH $7.91 MUELLER $15.00 Mueller|
191 |H83 UPPER VALVE PLATE 1 EACH $188.48 MUELLER $167.53 Mueller|
192 |METALLIC GASKET MUELLER F HYD 1 EACH $20.09 MUELLER $12.00 Mueller|
193 |H-87 SEAT RING MUELLER F.H. 1 EACH $260.13 MUELLER $231.22 Mueller|
194 [H-88/A-45 MAIN VALVE MUELLER 1 EACH $139.96 MUELLER $124.41 Mueller|
195 [H-89/A-46 LOWER VALVE PLATE MUELLER 1 EACH $23.55 MUELLER $23.55 Mueller|
196 |H-90 VALVE PLATE NUT MUELLER 1 EACH $8.61 MUELLER $8.61 Mueller|
197 |H-91 CAP NUT MUELLER 1 EACH $22.21 MUELLER $22.21 Mueller|
198 [H93/A12 STEM O RING MUELLER 1 EACH $7.04 MUELLER $7.04 Mueller|
199 |H-94 SET SCREW MUELLER 1 EACH $3.24 MUELLER $6.00 Mueller|
200 [H-95 SAFETY SLEEVE MUELLER 1 EACH $43.74 MUELLER $38.88 Mueller|
201 |H-98/A7 OIL FILLER PLUG MUELLER 1 EACH $3.66 MUELLER $3.66 Mueller|
202 [H100 BONNET O RING MUELLER 1 EACH $7.04 MUELLER $8.00 Mueller|
203 |H101/A3 HOLD DOWN NUT O RING MUELLER 1 EACH $7.04 MUELLER $7.04 Mueller|
204 |12 INCH MUELLER EXTENSION STEM OLD STYLE 1 EACH $168.41 MUELLER $347.71 Mueller|
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RFB# 19104 - Water Supplies
Bid Evaluation

Rl Praitle

Bass & Hays and USA Bluebook returned "No Bid" for this section
APSCO & Fortiline, Inc. were non-responsive for the entire bid

Fire Hydrant & Valve Parts

Core & Main

Ferguson Waterworks

Description Unit Price Manufacturer # Unit Price Manufacturer #
Mueller (continued)
205 |12 INCH MUELLER FIRE HYD. EXTENSIONS 1 EACH $293.75 MUELLER $347.71 Mueller|
206 |12 INCH MUELLER FIRE HYDRANT EXTEN.OLD S 1 EACH $293.75 MUELLER $347.71 Mueller|
207 |12 INCH MUELLER STEM EXTENSION NEW STYLE 1972 AND LATER 1 EACH $144.53 MUELLER $347.71 Mueller|
208 [175495 SOLID STEM COUPLING MUELLER 1 EACH $67.81 MUELLER $12.00 Mueller|
209 (175523 SOLID FLANGE MUELLER 1 EACH $79.55 MUELLER $20.00 Mueller|
210 |18 INCH MUELLER EXTENSION STEM NEW STYLE 1972 AND LATER 1 EACH $150.41 MUELLER $342.00 Mueller|
211 |24 INCH MUELLER EXTENSION STEM NEW STYLE 1972 AND LATER 1 EACH $161.25 MUELLER $428.84 Mueller|
212 |24 INCH MUELLER FIRE HYD EXTENSION 1 EACH $387.50 MUELLER $428.84 Mueller|
213 [280375 EXTENSION ACCESSARY KIT MUELLER HYDRANT 1 EACH $261.49 MUELLER $232.43 Mueller|
214 [6INCH EXTENSION STEMS OLD STYLE 1 EACH $161.28 MUELLER $297.79 Mueller|
215 |6 INCH MUELLER EXTENSION STEM NEW STYLE 1972 AND LATER 1 EACH $132.60 MUELLER $297.79 Mueller|
216 |6 INCH MUELLER FIRE HYD EXTENSION 1 EACH $256.25 MUELLER $297.79 Mueller|
217 |6 INCH MUELLER FIRE HYDRANT EXTEN.OLD STYLE 1 EACH $256.25 MUELLER $297.79 Mueller|
218 |A-111977-1986 UPPER STEM FOR MUELLER SUPER CENTURION F.H. 1 EACH $165.50 MUELLER $147.11 Mueller|
219 |[A-111987 UPPER STEM FOR MUELLER SUPER CENTURION F.H. 1 EACH $158.33 MUELLER $140.73 Mueller|
220 [H-102 LOCK WASHER FOR MUELLER FIRE HYDRANT 1 EACH $12.85 MUELLER $10.00 Mueller|
221 [H-103 UPPER STEM MUELLER NEW STYLE 1 EACH $173.18 MUELLER $50.00 Mueller|
222 [H-125 SAFETY STEM COUPLING MUELLER 1 EACH $67.81 MUELLER $35.00 Mueller|
223 [H-136 CLEVIS PIN MUELLER NEW 1 EACH $9.71 MUELLER $10.00 Mueller|
224 [H-137 COTTER PIN MUELLER NEW 1 EACH $1.54 MUELLER $10.00 Mueller|
225 [BONNETT KIT 1 EACH $64.90 MUELLER $61.08 Mueller|
226 |[MAIN VALVE KIT 1 EACH $424.70 MUELLER $426.58 Mueller|
240 |MUELLER COLLISION KIT SUPER CENTURION 1 EACH $160.00 MUELLER $185.62 Mueller|
241 |MUELLER 107 COLLISION KIT 1 EACH $160.00 MUELLER $185.62 Mueller|
242 |MUELLER IMPROVED COLLISION KIT 1 EACH $160.00 MUELLER $185.62 Mueller|
Total Mueller $6,869.48 $7,753.93
Kennedy
227 [K8101 ALAMITE FITTINGS; FOR KENNEDY HYDRANTS 1 EACH $5.78 KENNEDY
228 [K8102 OPERATING NUT; FOR KENNEDY HYDRANTS 1 EACH $200.48 KENNEDY
229 [K8105 O RINGS; FOR KENNEDY HYDRANTS 1 EACH $9.08 KENNEDY
230 [K8106 THRUST WASHER; FOR KENNEDY HYDRANTS 1 EACH $3.30 KENNEDY
231 [K8118 BOLTS AND NUTS KENNEDY F.HYD. 1 EACH $11.55 KENNEDY
232 [K8131 MAIN VALVES; FOR KENNEDY HYDRANTS 1 EACH $147.68 KENNEDY
233 [12 INCH KENNEDY FIRE HYD EXTENSION 1 EACH $569.78 KENNEDY
234 |2 1/2 INCH NOZZEL CAPS; FOR KENNEDY HYDRANTS 1 EACH $71.78 KENNEDY
235 [BONNETTKIT 1 EACH $65.00 KENNEDY
236 [MAIN VALVE KIT 1 EACH $316.20 KENNEDY
244 |KENNEDY HYDRANTS COLLISION KITS 1 EACH $230.00 KENNEDY No Bid
Total Kennedy $1,630.63
M&H
237 |6 INCH M AND H FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $487.94 MH
238 |12 INCH M AND H FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION 1 EACH $569.78 MH
246 |M AND H COLLISON KIT 1 EACH $230.00 MH No Bid
Total M&H| $1,287.72
Other
247 |FIRE HYDRANT OIL (GALLON) 1 GALLON $37.00 HRP $46.45
248 Percentage Discount for Items not Specified
(Example for 5%: Type -.05 for discount and .05 for markup) % -5% -15%
Total Other $37.00 $46.45
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RFB# 19104 - Water Supplies Bass & Hays and USA Bluebook returned "No Bid" for this section
Bid Evaluation APSCO & Fortiline, Inc. were non-responsive for the entire bid
Water Warehouse Stock Core & Main Ferguson Waterworks
Description Unit Price Manufacturer # Unit Price Manufacturer #
Fittings

1 11/2 INCH BRASS COUPLING 1 EACH $23.25 VARIES $19.91 Matco Norca
2 11/2 INCH BRASS ELLS 1 EACH $23.25 VARIES $19.91 Matco Norca
3 11/2 INCH BRASS PLUG IP 1 EACH $12.51 VARIES $10.72 Matco Norca
4 11/2 INCH BRASS TEES 1 EACH $31.29 VARIES $26.79 Matco Norca
5 11/2 INCH X1 1/4 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $15.86 VARIES $13.59 Matco Norca
6 11/2 INCH X1 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $15.86 VARIES $13.59 Matco Norca
7 11/2 INCH X2 INCH BRASS ALL THREAD 1 EACH $4.70 VARIES $3.96 Matco Norca
8 11/2 INCH X3/4 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $15.86 VARIES $13.59 Matco Norca
9 11/2 INCH X4 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $8.43 VARIES $9.50 Matco Norca
10 11/2 INCH X6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $12.45 VARIES $14.03 Matco Norca
11 1 INCH BRASS COUPLING 1 EACH $10.70 VARIES $9.17 Matco Norca
12 1 INCH BRASS 90 ELL 1 EACH $11.63 VARIES $9.96 Matco Norca
13 1 INCH BRASS PLUG IP 1 EACH $7.14 VARIES $6.12 Matco Norca
14 1 INCH BRASS STREET 90 ELL 1 EACH $16.10 VARIES $13.78 Matco Norca
15 1 INCH BRASS TEE FEMALE 1 EACH $16.10 VARIES $13.78 Matco Norca
16 1 INCH X 3/4 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $6.54 VARIES $5.61 Matco Norca
17 1INCH X 3 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $3.69 VARIES $4.16 Matco Norca
18 1INCH X 6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $7.08 VARIES $7.97 Matco Norca
19 2 1/2 INCH X1 1/2 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $49.40 VARIES $42.30 Matco Norca
20 2 1/2INCH X 2 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $49.41 VARIES $42.30 Matco Norca
21 2 INCH BRASS CAPS 1 EACH $32.18 VARIES $27.55 Matco Norca
22 2 INCH BRASS COUPLING 1 EACH $38.44 VARIES $32.91 Matco Norca
23 2 INCH BRASS 90 ELBOW 1 EACH $37.53 VARIES $32.13 Matco Norca
24 2 INCH BRASS PLUG IP 1 EACH $20.54 VARIES $17.59 Matco Norca
25 2 INCH BRASS TEES 1 EACH $51.86 VARIES $44.40 Matco Norca
26 2 INCH MALE X FLARED COUPLING 1 EACH $106.98 FORD $109.87 Matco Norca
27 2 INCH X1 1/2 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $19.58 VARIES $16.76 Matco Norca
28 2 INCH X1 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $19.58 VARIES $16.76 Matco Norca
29 2 INCH X2 INCH BRASS ALL THREAD 1 EACH $6.65 VARIES $7.50 Matco Norca
30 2 INCH X CLOSE NIPPLE 1 EACH $6.65 VARIES $7.50 Matco Norca
31 2 INCH X3/4 INCH BRASS BUSHING 1 EACH $19.58 VARIES $16.76 Matco Norca
32 2 INCH X4 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $10.84 VARIES $12.22 Matco Norca
33 2 INCH X6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $16.01 VARIES $18.04 Matco Norca
34 2 INCH X8 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $21.36 VARIES $24.07 Matco Norca
35 3/4 INCH BRASS COUPLINGS 1 EACH $6.28 VARIES $5.37 Matco Norca
36 3/4 INCH BRASS 90 ELL 1 EACH $7.14 VARIES $6.12 Matco Norca
37 3/4 INCH BRASS PLUG IP 1 EACH $4.46 VARIES $3.83 Matco Norca
38 3/4 INCH BRASS STREET 90 ELL 1 EACH $9.84 VARIES $8.42 Matco Norca
39 3/4 INCH BRASS TEE FEMALE 1 EACH $8.91 VARIES $7.64 Matco Norca
40 3/4 INCH X2 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $1.90 VARIES $2.14 Matco Norca
41 3/4 INCH X4 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $3.31 VARIES $3.73 Matco Norca
42 3/4 INCH X6 INCH BRASS NIPPLE 1 EACH $4.84 VARIES $5.46 Matco Norca
43 3 INCH X2 INCH BRASS BUSHING IP 1 EACH $72.74 VARIES $62.27 Matco Norca
44 3/4 INCH CC BRASS PLUG 1 EACH $9.68 MUELLER $10.04 Mueller
45 1 INCH CC BRASS PLUG 1 EACH $10.22 MUELLER $10.60 Mueller
46 11/2 INCH CC BRASS PLUG 1 EACH $17.57 MUELLER $18.86 Mueller
47 2 INCH CC BRASS PLUG 1 EACH $23.57 MUELLER $24.45 Mueller
48 METER YOKE 1 INCH X 1 INCH X 10 INCH RISE 1 EACH $131.42 MUELLER $136.31 Mueller
49 METER YOKE 5/8 INCH X 3/4 INCH X 12 INCH RISE 1 EACH $73.21 MUELLER $75.94 Mueller
50 METER YOKE 5/8 INCH X 3/4 INCH X 15 INCH RISE 1 EACH $76.70 MUELLER $79.55 Mueller
51 METER YOKE 5/8 INCH X 3/4 INCH X 24 INCH RISE 1 EACH $91.85 MUELLER $95.27 Mueller
52 METER YOKE 5/8 INCH X 3/4 INCH X 7 INCH RISE 1 EACH $67.60 MUELLER $70.12 Mueller
53 METER YOKE 5/8 INCH X 3/4 INCH X 9 INCH RISE 1 EACH $69.78 MUELLER $72.38 Mueller
54 11/2 INCH COMPRESSION ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $141.25 MUELLER $146.09 Mueller
55 11/2 INCH COMPRESSION UNION 1 EACH $53.50 MUELLER $55.49 Mueller
56 11/2 INCH FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $128.73 MUELLER $133.52 Mueller
57 11/2 INCH FLARED ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $137.68 MUELLER $142.81 Mueller
58 11/2 INCH FLARED CC CORPORATION 1 EACH $106.86 MUELLER $110.84 Mueller
59 11/2 INCH FEMALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $47.62 MUELLER $49.39 Mueller
60 11/2 INCH FLARED X FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $195.15 FORD $156.27 Mueller
61 11/2 INCH FEMALE X FLARED COUPLING 1 EACH $56.36 MUELLER $42.87 Mueller
62 11/2 INCH MALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $37.24 MUELLER $38.63 Mueller
63 11/2 INCH MALE X FLARED COUPLING 1 EACH $44.95 MUELLER $46.63 Mueller
64 1 INCH COMPRESSION ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $40.53 MUELLER $42.04 Mueller
65 1 INCH COMPRESSION UNION 1 EACH $15.17 MUELLER $15.73 Mueller
66 1 INCH FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $45.78 MUELLER $47.49 Mueller
67 1 INCH COMPRESSION X PACK JOINT COUPLING 1 EACH $39.19 MUELLER $40.65 Mueller
68 1INCH FLARED ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $37.79 MUELLER $39.20 Mueller
69 1 INCH FLARED X FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $56.34 MUELLER $58.44 Mueller
70 1 INCH FEMALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $17.47 MUELLER $18.12 Mueller
71 1 INCH FEMALE X FLARED COUPLING 1 EACH $15.32 MUELLER $15.89 Mueller
72 1INCH FEMALE THREAD ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $33.77 MUELLER $35.03 Mueller
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Fittings (continued)

73 1 INCH FLARED X PACK JOINT COUPLING 1 EACH $19.07 MUELLER $19.78 Mueller
74 1 INCH MALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $13.47 MUELLER $13.97 Mueller
75 1 INCH METER COUPLING 1 EACH $10.64 MUELLER $11.03 Mueller
76 1 INCH MALE COUPLING 1 EACH $15.94 MUELLER $11.03 Mueller
77 2 INCH COMPRESSON ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $181.33 MUELLER $188.09 Mueller
78 2 INCH COMPRESSON UNION 1 EACH $72.25 MUELLER $74.94 Mueller
79 2 INCH FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $187.44 MUELLER $194.41 Mueller
80 2 INCH FLARED ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $185.28 MUELLER $192.18 Mueller
81 2 INCH FEMALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $56.75 MUELLER $58.86 Mueller
82 2 INCH FLARED X FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $221.21 MUELLER $229.45 Mueller
83 2 INCH FEMALE X FLARED COUPLING 1 EACH $77.98 MUELLER $80.88 Mueller
84 2 INCH MALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $54.26 MUELLER $56.28 Mueller
85 2 INCH X3/4 INCH COMBINATION TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $13.01 MUELLER $13.49 Mueller
86 3/4 INCH COMPRESSION ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $29.59 MUELLER $30.69 Mueller
87 3/4 INCH COMPRESSION UNION 1 EACH $16.46 MUELLER $16.29 Mueller
88 3/4 INCH FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $39.55 MUELLER $41.02 Mueller
89 3/4 INCH FLARE ADAPTER FOR CAMBRIDGE BRASS PARTS 1 EACH $25.00 MUELLER $12.73 Mueller
90 3/4 INCH FLARED ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $27.76 MUELLER $28.80 Mueller
91 3/4 INCH FLARED X FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $28.95 MUELLER $30.03 Mueller
92 3/4 INCH FEMALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $12.22 MUELLER $12.67 Mueller
93 3/4 INCH FEMALE X FLARED COUPLING 1 EACH $10.05 MUELLER $10.43 Mueller
94 3/4 INCH FEMALE THREAD ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $22.06 MUELLER $22.88 Mueller
95 3/4 INCH FLARED X METER SWIVEL 90 BEND 1 EACH $26.94 MUELLER $27.95 Mueller
96 3/4 INCH FLARED WEDDING RING ANGLE VALVE 1 EACH $27.76 MUELLER $28.80 Mueller
97 3/4 INCH FLARED X PACK JOINT COUPLING 1 EACH $12.98 MUELLER $13.47 Mueller
98 3/4INCH MALE COMPRESSION COUPLING 1 EACH $11.39 MUELLER $11.82 Mueller
99 3/4INCH METER COUPLING 1 EACH $6.92 MUELLER $7.18 Mueller
100 |3/4INCH X 3 INCH METER COUPLING 1 EACH $17.58 MUELLER $18.23 Mueller
101  |3/4 INCH MALE X FLARED COUPLING 1 EACH $10.12 MUELLER $10.50 Mueller
102 |3/4INCH X 4 INCH FLARED X FEMALE CURB STOP 1 EACH $28.95 MUELLER $30.03 Mueller
103 |3/4INCH X 3/4 INCH X 1 INCH COMPRESSON TEE 1 EACH $34.09 MUELLER $35.36 Mueller
104  |3/4INCH X 3/4 INCH X 1 INCH FLARED TEE BRASS 1 EACH $45.00 MUELLER $34.47 Mueller
105 |11/2 INCH FLARED IP CORPORATION STOP 1 EACH $106.86 MUELLER $110.84 Mueller
106 |11/2 INCH FLARED SPLICER 1 EACH $64.24 MUELLER $66.63 Mueller
107 |10 INCH X1 1/2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $40.38 MUELLER $41.88 Mueller
108 |10 INCH X1 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $31.72 MUELLER $32.90 Mueller
109 |10 INCH X2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $40.38 MUELLER $41.88 Mueller
110 |10 INCH X3/4 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $31.72 MUELLER $32.90 Mueller
111 |12 INCH X1 1/2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $47.46 MUELLER $49.22 Mueller
112 |12 INCH X1 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 313 1 EACH $38.04 MUELLER $39.46 Mueller
113 |12 INCH X2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $48.41 MUELLER $50.21 Mueller
114 |12 INCH X3/4 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $38.04 MUELLER $39.46 Mueller
115 |1 INCH COMPRESSON CC THREAD CORP. 1 EACH $37.70 MUELLER $39.11 Mueller
116 |1 INCH COMPRESSION IP CORPORATION 1 EACH $37.30 MUELLER $39.11 Mueller
117 |1INCH COPPER PLUG DISC. 1 EACH $1.52 MUELLER $1.57 Mueller
118 |1INCH FLARED CC THREAD CORP. 1 EACH $35.44 MUELLER $36.76 Mueller
119 |1INCH FLARED IP CORPORATION 1 EACH $35.44 MUELLER $36.76 Mueller
120 |1INCH FLARED SPLICER 1 EACH $16.34 MUELLER $16.95 Mueller
121 |2 INCH COMPRESSON IP CORP 1 EACH $176.72 MUELLER $190.70 Mueller
122 |2 INCH COPPER PLUGS DISC 1 EACH $4.61 MUELLER $4.78 Mueller
123 |2 INCH FLARED CC CORPORATION 1 EACH $186.66 MUELLER $193.45 Mueller
124 |2 INCH FLARED IP CORPORATION 1 EACH $186.66 MUELLER $194.81 Mueller
125 |2 INCH FLARED SPLICER 1 EACH $81.99 MUELLER $85.04 Mueller
126 |2 INCH X1 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $13.01 MUELLER $13.49 Mueller
127 |2 INCH X 3/4 INCH CC THREAD TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $13.01 MUELLER $13.49 Mueller
128 |3/4 INCH COMPRESSON CC THREAD CORP. 1 EACH $24.89 MUELLER $25.82 Mueller
129  |3/4 INCH COMPRESSION IP CORPORATION 1 EACH $24.89 MUELLER $25.82 Mueller
130 |3/4 INCH COPPER PLUGS DISC 1 EACH $1.52 MUELLER $1.57 Mueller
131 |3/4 INCH FLARED CC THREAD CORPORATION 1 EACH $23.21 MUELLER $24.07 Mueller
132 |3/4 INCH FLARED IP CORPORATION 1 EACH $23.21 MUELLER $24.07 Mueller
133 |3/4 INCH FLARED SPLICER 1 EACH $9.93 MUELLER $10.30 Mueller
134 |4 INCH X 3/4 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 313 1 EACH $23.20 MUELLER $24.06 Mueller
135 |6 INCH X1 1/2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $27.34 MUELLER $28.36 Mueller
136 |6 INCH X 1 INCH CC THREAD TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $22.48 MUELLER $23.32 Mueller
137 |6 INCH X2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $27.70 MUELLER $28.73 Mueller
138 |6 INCH X3/4 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $22.48 MUELLER $23.32 Mueller
139 |8 INCH X1 1/2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 313 1 EACH $30.62 MUELLER $31.76 Mueller
140 |8 INCH X1 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $24.54 MUELLER $25.46 Mueller
141 |8 INCH X2 INCH TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $30.62 MUELLER $31.76 Mueller
142 |8 INCH X3/4 INCH CC TAPPING SADDLE 1 EACH $24.54 MUELLER $25.46 Mueller
143 |3/4 INCH INSERT STIFFENERS 1 EACH $1.59 FORD $1.50 Mueller
144 |1 INCH INSERT STIFFENERS 1 EACH $1.69 FORD $1.50 Mueller
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Fittings (continued)

145 |1-1/2 INCH INSERT STIFFENERS 1 EACH $2.33 FORD $2.50 Mueller
146 |2 INCH INSERT STIFFENERS 1 EACH $2.33 FORD $2.50 Mueller
147  |3/4 INCH ULTRA - TITE COUPLING NUTS 1 EACH $13.00 SHARK BITE $1.50 Ford
148 |1 INCH ULTRA - TITE COUPLING NUTS 1 EACH $15.00 SHARK BITE $1.50 Ford
149 |1-1/2 INCH ULTRA - TITE COUPLING NUTS 1 EACH $40.00 SHARK BITE Not Made
150 |2 INCH UTLRA - TITE COUPLING NUTS 1 EACH $45.00 SHARK BITE Not Made

Total Fittings $6,008.51 $5,922.45

PVC Water Pipe

151 3/4 INCH POLYETHYLENE TUBING 1 FOOT $0.30 ENDOT $0.27 ADS
152 1 INCH POLYETHYLENE TUBING 1 FOOT $0.45 ENDOT $0.44 ADS
153 1-1/2 INCH POLYETHYLENE TUBING 1 FOOT $0.95 ENDOT $0.86 ADS
154 2 INCH POLYETHYLENE TUBING 1 FOOT $1.65 ENDOT $1.49 ADS
155 2 INCH SCH 80 PVC PIPE 1 FOOT $2.50 VARIES $1.18 Charlotte
156 6 INCH DR18 €900 PVC PIPE CLASS 150 1 FOOT $4.12 VARIES $4.12 Diamond
157 8 INCH DR18 €900 PVC PIPE CLASS 150 1 FOOT $7.15 VARIES $7.15 Diamond
158 10 INCH DR18 C900 PIPE CLASS 150 1 FOOT $10.73 VARIES $10.73 Diamond
159 12 INCH DR18 C900 PVC PIPE CLASS 150 1 FOOT $15.15 VARIES $15.15 Diamond
160 16 INCH DR18 C900 PIPE CLASS 150 1 FOOT $31.00 VARIES $30.00 Diamond

Total Water Pipe $74.00 $71.39

PVC Sewer Pipe

161 [4 INCH SDR 35 PVC 1 FOOT $0.86 VARIES $0.85 Diamond
162 [6 INCH SDR35PVC PIPE 1 FOOT $1.86 VARIES $1.85 Diamond
163 [8 INCH SDR35 PVC PIPE 1 FOOT $3.33 VARIES $3.33 Diamond
164 [10 INCH SDR35 PVC PIPE 1 FOOT $5.22 VARIES $5.22 Diamond
165 [12 INCH SDR35 PVC PIPE 1 FOOT $7.50 VARIES $7.50 Diamond
166 |15 INCH SDR35 PVC PIPE 1 FOOT $11.25 VARIES $11.16 Diamond

Total Sewer Pipe $30.02 $29.91

Sewer Parts

167 10 INCH SDR 35 22 1/2 BEND 1 FOOT $92.74 PLASTIC TRENDS $88.12 Multi
168 10 INCH SDR 35 45 BEND 1 FOOT $90.72 PLASTIC TRENDS $88.12 Multi
169 10 INCH X4 INCH SDR 35 WYE 1 FOOT $99.58 PLASTIC TRENDS $100.00 Multi
170 12 INCH SDR 35 22 1/2 BEND 1 FOOT $134.92 PLASTIC TRENDS $132.51 Multi
171 12 INCH SDR 35 45 DEGREE BEND 1 FOOT $140.88 PLASTIC TRENDS $135.20 Multi
172 12 INCH SDR35 COUPLING 1 FOOT $87.30 PLASTIC TRENDS $82.97 Multi
173 2 1/2 INCH CLEANOUT PLUG 1 FOOT $1.86 PLASTIC TRENDS $4.57 Brass
174 3 INCH CLEANOUT PLUG 1 FOOT $1.86 PLASTIC TRENDS $5.70 Brass
175 3 INCH RUBBER CLEANOUT CAP 1 FOOT $3.88 DS $2.25 Fernco
176 |4 INCH SDR 35 22 1/2 BEND 1 FOOT $2.65 PLASTIC TRENDS $2.51 Multi
177 |4 INCH SDR35 45 BEND 1 FOOT $2.40 PLASTIC TRENDS $2.29 Multi
178 |4 INCH SDR35 90 BEND 1 FOOT $2.80 PLASTIC TRENDS $2.68 Multi
179 |4 INCH SDR 35 REPAIR COUPLING 1 FOOT $1.60 PLASTIC TRENDS $4.69 Multi
180 |4 INCH SDR 35 X 3 INCH SCH 40 REDUC 1 FOOT $2.81 PLASTIC TRENDS $11.44 Multi
181 4 INCH X4 INCH X4 INCH SDR35 WYE 1 FOOT $4.40 PLASTIC TRENDS $4.18 Multi
182 4 INCH SCH 40-SDR 35 ADAPTER COUPLING 1 FOOT $4.05 PLASTIC TRENDS $7.33 Multi
183 4 INCH FEMALE CLEANOUT ADAPTER W/PLUG 1 FOOT $3.17 PLASTIC TRENDS $5.48 Multi
184 |4 INCH CLEANOUT POP UP PLUG 1 FOOT $4.40 PLASTIC TRENDS $3.50 Multi
185 4 INCH CLEANOUT PLUG W/RECESSED NUT 1 FOOT $4.44 PLASTIC TRENDS $5.76 Multi
186 |4 INCH RUBBER CLEANOUT CAP 1 FOOT $4.97 DS $2.80 Fernco
187 |4 INCH X 3 INCH SDR 35 REDUCER 1 FOOT $3.00 PLASTIC TRENDS $2.87 Multi
188 6 INCH SDR 35 22 1/2 BEND 1 FOOT $11.55 PLASTIC TRENDS $10.99 Multi
189 6 INCH SDR 35 45 BEND 1 FOOT $9.50 PLASTIC TRENDS $9.01 Multi
190 6 INCH SDR 35 REPAIR COUPLING 1 FOOT $5.85 PLASTIC TRENDS $5.52 Multi
191 6 INCH SDR 35 TEE 1 FOOT $13.20 PLASTIC TRENDS $12.52 Multi
192 6 INCH X6 INCH X6 INCH SDR35 CLEAN OUT WYE 1 FOOT $18.65 PLASTIC TRENDS $33.12 Multi
193 6 INCH CHERNE GRIPPER PLUG 1 FOOT $15.00 CHERNE $16.62 Cherne
194 6 INCH X4 INCH SDR35 REDUCER ECCENTRIC 1 FOOT $12.50 PLASTIC TRENDS $7.34 Multi
195 6 INCH X4 INCH SDR35 TEE 1 FOOT $12.90 PLASTIC TRENDS $12.26 Multi
196 6 INCH X4 INCH SDR35 WYE 1 FOOT $16.25 PLASTIC TRENDS $15.43 Multi
197 8 INCH SDR 35 WYE 1 FOOT $62.25 PLASTIC TRENDS $59.16 Multi
198 8 INCH CHERNE GRIPPER PLUG 1 FOOT $28.54 CHERNE $31.48 Cherne
199 8 INCH X4 INCH SDR35 REDUCER ECCENTRIC 1 FOOT $31.85 PLASTIC TRENDS $23.48 Multi
200 SEWER CITY SIDE CLEANOUT BOX (6" PVC BOX) 1 FOOT $5.00 DS $2.00 DFW Plastics
201 SEWER CITY SIDE CLEANOUT BOX LID (6" PVC LID) 1 FOOT $3.00 DS $1.81 DFW Plastics
202 10 INCH CLAY-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $38.54 FERNCO SR $37.71 Fernco
203 10 INCH PVC/CI-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $37.17 FERNCO SR $36.36 Fernco
204 10 INCH X4 INCH SDR35 SADDLE TEES W/BANDS 1 FOOT $31.80 PLASTIC TRENDS $25.14 Multi
205 10 INCH X 6 INCH SDR35 SADDLE TEES W/BANDS 1 FOOT $36.70 PLASTIC TRENDS $28.72 Multi
206 12 INCH CLAY-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $43.71 FERNCO SR $42.76 Fernco
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207 |12 INCH X 4 INCH SDR 35 SADDLE TEES W/BANDS 1 FOOT $32.70 PLASTIC TRENDS $25.84 Multi
208 |12 INCH X 6 INCH SDR 35 SADDLE TEES W/BANDS 1 FOOT $37.50 PLASTIC TRENDS $29.70 Multi
209 |15 INCH CLAY TO PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $140.66 FERNCO SR $137.60 Fernco
210 |4 INCH SDR35 CAPS 1 FOOT $1.50 PLASTIC TRENDS $1.32 Multi
211 |4 INCH CLAY-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $16.54 FERNCO SR $13.75 Fernco
212 |4 INCH CLEANOUT PLUG W/RAISED NUT 1 FOOT $1.92 PLASTIC TRENDS $1.83 Multi
213 |4 INCH DELTA SOCKET-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $13.21 FERNCO SR $16.18 Fernco
214 |4 INCH PVC/CI-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $12.50 FERNCO SR $12.23 Fernco
215 |6INCH SDR 35 CAPS 1 FOOT $5.15 PLASTIC TRENDS $4.84 Multi
216 |6 INCH CLEANOUT /PLUG 1 FOOT $9.66 PLASTIC TRENDS $16.00 Multi
217 |6 INCH CLAY-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $20.47 FERNCO SR $20.01 Fernco
218 |6 INCH SDR 35 PLUG W/RAISED NUT 1 FOOT $9.66 PLASTIC TRENDS $9.19 Multi
219 |6INCH DELTA SOCKET-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $20.47 FERNCO SR $20.02 Fernco
220 |6INCH X 4 INCH SDR 35 SADDLE TEES W/BANDS 1 FOOT $19.40 PLASTIC TRENDS $15.37 Multi
221 |8 INCH SDR 35 22 1/2 BEND 1 FOOT $29.90 PLASTIC TRENDS $28.40 Multi
222 |8 INCH SDR 35 45 BEND 1 FOOT $25.85 PLASTIC TRENDS $24.54 Multi
223 |8 INCH SDR 35 CAP 1 FOOT $16.70 PLASTIC TRENDS $15.87 Multi
224 |8 INCH SDR 35 REPAIR COUPLING 1 FOOT $18.15 PLASTIC TRENDS $17.20 Multi
225 |8 INCH SDR 35 TEE 1 FOOT $50.79 PLASTIC TRENDS $51.11 Multi
226 |8 INCH CLAY-PVC/CI CT ADAPTER 1 FOOT $27.79 FERNCO SR $27.18 Fernco
227 |8 INCH X4 INCH SDR35 TEE 1 FOOT $29.00 PLASTIC TRENDS $27.62 Multi
228 |8 INCH X4 INCH SDR 35 SADDLE TEES W/BANDS 1 FOOT $27.00 PLASTIC TRENDS $22.88 Multi
229 |8 INCH X 6 INCH SDR 35 WYE 1 FOOT $41.02 PLASTIC TRENDS $39.81 Multi
230 |8 INCH X8 INCH SDR35 TEE 1 FOOT $50.79 PLASTIC TRENDS $51.11 Multi
231 |4 INCH SDR35 22 1/2 BEND SXH 1 FOOT $3.25 PLASTIC TRENDS $3.10 Multi
232 |4 INCH SDR35 45 BEND SXH 1 FOOT $3.25 PLASTIC TRENDS $3.10 Multi
Total Sewer Parts $1,793.22 $1,742.20
Cast Iron Fittings

233 2 INCH MJ 45 BEND 1 EACH $52.14 TYLER DOMESTIC $52.11 Tyler-Union
234 2 INCH MJ SOLID CAP 1 EACH $20.46 TYLER DOMESTIC $20.45 Tyler-Union
235 2 INCH MJ SOLID PLUG 1 EACH $20.46 TYLER DOMESTIC $20.45 Tyler-Union
236 2 INCH X2 INCH X2 INCH MJ TEE 1 EACH $80.52 TYLER DOMESTIC $80.47 Tyler-Union
237 2 INCH X 14 INCH MJSS 1 EACH $85.78 TYLER DOMESTIC $71.89 Tyler-Union
238 2 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $12.54 TYLER DOMESTIC $10.28 Tyler-Union
239 2 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $4.35 TYLER DOMESTIC $14.20 Tyler-Union
240 2 INCH X2 INCH MJ TAPPED TEE 1 EACH NA NOT MADE
241 3 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $13.65 TYLER DOMESTIC $14.47 Tyler-Union
242 3 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $5.21 TYLER DOMESTIC $3.02 Tyler-Union
243 3 INCH MJ 22 1/2 BEND 1 EACH $33.15 TYLER DOMESTIC $33.64 Tyler-Union
244 3 INCH X3 INCH BLIND TAPPED FLANGE (COMPANION) 1 EACH $26.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $27.66 Tyler-Union
245 4 INCH BLIND FLANGE 1 EACH $44.20 TYLER DOMESTIC $44.85 Tyler-Union
246 4 INCH C 900 RETAINING GLANDS 1 EACH $19.77 TYLER DOMESTIC $21.03 Tyler-Union
247 4 INCH CAST IRON FLANGE ADAPTER 1 EACH $52.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $59.36 Tyler-Union
248 4 INCH FLANGED 45 DEGREE BEND 1 EACH $116.35 TYLER DOMESTIC $118.06 Tyler-Union
249 4 INCH FLANGED 90 BEND 1 EACH $130.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $131.91 Tyler-Union
250 4 INCH FLANGE X 3 MJ REDUCER 1 EACH $112.34 TYLER DOMESTIC $97.96 Tyler-Union
251 4 INCH MJ 22 1/2 DEREE BEND 1 EACH $50.70 TYLER DOMESTIC $51.45 Tyler-Union
252 4 INCH MJ 45 BEND 1 EACH $52.65 TYLER DOMESTIC $53.43 Tyler-Union
253 4 INCH MJ 90 BEND 1 EACH $63.05 TYLER DOMESTIC $63.98 Tyler-Union
254 4 INCH MJ OVERSIZE SOLID SLEEVE 1 EACH $210.30 TYLER DOMESTIC $223.72 Tyler-Union
255 4 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $16.90 TYLER DOMESTIC $25.40 Tyler-Union
256 4 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $7.57 TYLER DOMESTIC $4.65 Tyler-Union
257 4 INCH MJ SPLIT GLAND 1 EACH $7.80 TYLER DOMESTIC $8.30 Tyler-Union
258 4 INCH MJ SOLID PLUG 1 EACH $37.70 TYLER DOMESTIC $38.26 Tyler-Union
259 4 INCH X 12 INCH MJ SOLID SLEEVES DI 1 EACH $58.50 TYLER DOMESTIC $59.36 Tyler-Union
260 4 INCH X 2 INCH FLANGED TAPPED TEE 1 EACH $89.70 TYLER DOMESTIC $91.02 Tyler-Union
261 4 INCH X4 INCH BLIND TAPPED FLANGE (COMPANION) 1 EACH $39.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $39.57 Tyler-Union
262 4 INCH MJ TEE BOLTS & NUTS 1 EACH $7.80 TYLER DOMESTIC $101.40 Tyler-Union
263 6 INCH 90 ANCHOR BEND 1 EACH $192.40 TYLER DOMESTIC $195.23 Tyler-Union
264 6 INCH ANCHOR NIPPLE SPLIT GLAND 1 EACH $18.20 TYLER DOMESTIC $131.79 Tyler-Union
265 6 INCH X6 INCH X6 INCH ANCHORING TEE 1 EACH $165.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $187.61 Tyler-Union
266 6 INCH BLIND FLANGE 1 EACH $76.70 TYLER DOMESTIC $77.83 Tyler-Union
267 6 INCH FLANGE ADAPTER 1 EACH $59.15 TYLER DOMESTIC $80.47 Tyler-Union
268 6 INCH C900 RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $23.95 TYLER DOMESTIC $25.48 Tyler-Union
269 6 INCH CI OR DUCTILE UNIFLANGE ADAPTER 1 EACH $42.84 FORD $101.85 Tyler-Union
270 6 INCH DUCTILE IRON RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $18.93 TYLER DOMESTIC $20.14 Tyler-Union
271 6 INCH FLANGE 90 BEND DUCTILE IRON 1 EACH $191.10 TYLER DOMESTIC $193.91 Tyler-Union
272 6 INCH FLANGE TEE 1 EACH $281.45 TYLER DOMESTIC $285.60 Tyler-Union
273 6 INCH FLAP VALVE 1 EACH $171.00 WATERMAN $190.00 Waterman
274 6 INCH MJ 22 1/2 DUCTILE BENDS 1 EACH $74.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $75.85 Tyler-Union
275 6 INCH MJ 45 DUCTILE BENDS 1 EACH $81.90 TYLER DOMESTIC $83.11 Tyler-Union
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276 |6 INCH MJ 90 DUCTILE BENDS 1 EACH $99.45 TYLER DOMESTIC $100.91 Tyler-Union
277 |6 INCH X6 INCH X6 INCH MJ-FLANGE TEE 1 EACH $156.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $158.30 Tyler-Union
278 |6 INCH MJ GASKETS 1 EACH $5.20 TYLER DOMESTIC $4.21 Tyler-Union
279 |6 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $20.15 TYLER DOMESTIC $21.36 Tyler-Union
280 |6 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $10.64 TYLER DOMESTIC $10.41 Tyler-Union
281 |6 INCH MJ SOLID CAPS DUCTILE 1 EACH $39.65 TYLER DOMESTIC $40.23 Tyler-Union
282 |6 INCH MJ SPLIT GLAND 1 EACH $9.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $10.37 Tyler-Union
283 |6 INCH MJ SOLID PLUG 1 EACH $39.65 TYLER DOMESTIC $60.68 Tyler-Union
284 |6 INCH X12 INCH MJ SOLID SLEEVE 1 EACH $87.10 TYLER DOMESTIC $88.38 Tyler-Union
285 |6 INCH MJ TEE 1 EACH $143.65 TYLER DOMESTIC $145.77 Tyler-Union
286 |6 INCH MJ WYE 1 EACH $189.80 TYLER DOMESTIC $192.60 Tyler-Union
287 |6 INCH X12 INCH GRADE LOCKING NIPPLE 1 EACH $400.00 GRADELOK $302.10 Assured Flow
288 |6 INCH X12 INCH MJ-GRADELOCK 1 EACH $400.00 GRADELOK $296.57 Assured Flow
289 |6 INCH X12 INCH MJ OFFSET 1 EACH $382.23 TYLER DOMESTIC $120.00 Tyler-Union
290 |6 INCH X13 INCH ANCHOR NIPPLE 1 EACH $116.35 TYLER DOMESTIC $118.06 Tyler-Union
291 |6 INCH X18 INCH ANCHOR NIPPLE 1 EACH $143.65 TYLER DOMESTIC $145.77 Tyler-Union
292 |6 INCH X 24 INCH ANCHOR NIPPLE 1 EACH $170.30 TYLER DOMESTIC $172.81 Tyler-Union
293 |6 INCH X 24 INCH FLANGE NIPPLE 1 EACH $225.00 LONESTAR $160.00 US Pipe
294 |6 INCH X24 INCH GRADE LOCKING NIPPLE 1 EACH $550.74 GRADELOK $385.07 Assured Flow
295 |6 INCH X 2 INCH BLIND TAPPED FLANGE 1 EACH $102.70 TYLER DOMESTIC $104.21 Tyler-Union
296 |6 INCH X 2 INCH IP MJ TAPPED CAP 1 EACH $63.70 TYLER DOMESTIC $64.64 Tyler-Union
297 |6 INCH X36 INCH ANCHOR NIPPLE 1 EACH $200.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $131.95 Tyler-Union
298 |6INCH X4 INCH FLANGED TEE 1 EACH $264.55 TYLER DOMESTIC $268.45 Tyler-Union
299 |6INCH X4 INCH MJ REDUCER 1 EACH $57.85 TYLER DOMESTIC $58.70 Tyler-Union
300 |6INCHX6INCH GRADE LOCKING NIPPLE 1 EACH $310.99 GRADELOK $169.62 Assured Flow
301 |6 INCH MJ TEE BOLTS & NUTS 1 EACH $11.05 TYLER DOMESTIC $145.77 Tyler-Union
302 |8 INCH C900 RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $35.44 TYLER DOMESTIC $37.70 Tyler-Union
303 |8 INCH DUCTILE IRON RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $28.94 TYLER DOMESTIC $30.79 Tyler-Union
304 |8 INCH FLANGE 11 1/4 DEGREE BEND 1 EACH $352.30 TYLER DOMESTIC $357.49 Tyler-Union
305 |8 INCH FLANGE TO FLANGE 90 BEND 1 EACH $348.40 TYLER DOMESTIC $353.53 Tyler-Union
306 |8 INCH FLANGED TEE DUCTILE IRON 1 EACH $672.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $682.66 Tyler-Union
307 |8 INCH FLAP VALVE 1 EACH $198.00 WATERMAN $220.00 Waterman
308 |8 INCH FLANGE X 4 MJ REDUCER 1 EACH $240.44 TYLER DOMESTIC $255.79 Tyler-Union
309 |8 INCHX8INCH X 8 INCH FLANGED WYE 1 EACH $805.35 TYLER DOMESTIC $817.21 Tyler-Union
310 |8 INCH MJ 22 1/2 DUCTILE BEND 1 EACH $113.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $115.43 Tyler-Union
311 |8 INCH MJ 45 BEND DUCTILE 1 EACH $116.35 TYLER DOMESTIC $118.06 Tyler-Union
312 |8 INCH MJTO 6 INCH FLANGE TEE 1 EACH $197.60 TYLER DOMESTIC $200.51 Tyler-Union
313 |8 INCH MJ 90 DUCTILE BEND 1 EACH $145.60 TYLER DOMESTIC $147.74 Tyler-Union
314 |8 INCH MJ TO FLANGE ADAPTER DUCTILE 1 EACH $120.25 TYLER DOMESTIC $122.02 Tyler-Union
315 |8 INCH MJ-FLANGE TEE 1 EACH $285.35 TYLER DOMESTIC $289.50 Tyler-Union
316 |8 INCH MJ SOLID CAPS 1 EACH $62.40 TYLER DOMESTIC $63.32 Tyler-Union
317 |8 INCH MJ SPLIT GLAND 1 EACH $11.70 TYLER DOMESTIC $12.45 Tyler-Union
318 |8 INCH MJ GASKETS 1 EACH $5.85 TYLER DOMESTIC $4.60 Tyler-Union
319 |8 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $23.40 TYLER DOMESTIC $35.17 Tyler-Union
320 |8 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $11.94 TYLER DOMESTIC $15.26 Tyler-Union
321 |8 INCH MJ SOLID PLUG 1 EACH $85.15 TYLER DOMESTIC $86.40 Tyler-Union
322 |8 INCH X12 INCH MJ SOLID SLEEVE DI 1 EACH $113.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $115.43 Tyler-Union
323 |8 INCH MJ TEE 1 EACH $213.85 TYLER DOMESTIC $217.00 Tyler-Union
324 |8 INCH ONE BOLT SOLID CAP 1 EACH $196.97 ROMAC $231.04 Romac
325 |8 INCH X13 INCH ANCHOR COUPLING 1 EACH $172.90 TYLER DOMESTIC $175.45 Tyler-Union
326 |8 INCH X 4 INCH MJ REDUCER 1 EACH $89.05 TYLER DOMESTIC $90.36 Tyler-Union
327 |8 INCH X 6 INCH MJ REDUCER 1 EACH $95.55 TYLER DOMESTIC $96.96 Tyler-Union
328 |8 INCH X 8INCH X 6 INCH MJ TEE SHORT BODY DI 1 EACH $180.05 TYLER DOMESTIC $182.70 Tyler-Union
329 [8INCH MJ TEE BOLTS & NUTS 1 EACH $11.05 TYLER DOMESTIC $16.00 EGW
330 |10 INCH C900 RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $67.07 TYLER DOMESTIC $71.35 Tyler-Union
331 |10 INCH DUCTILE IRON RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $42.81 TYLER DOMESTIC $45.54 Tyler-Union
332 |10 INCH MJ SPLIT GLAND 1 EACH $17.55 TYLER DOMESTIC $18.67 Tyler-Union
333 |10 INCH MJ SOLID PLUG 1 EACH $109.20 TYLER DOMESTIC $110.81 Tyler-Union
334 |10 INCH MJ GASKETS 1 EACH $8.45 TYLER DOMESTIC $5.53 Tyler-Union
335 |10 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $32.50 TYLER DOMESTIC $35.00 EGW
336 |10 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $21.51 TYLER DOMESTIC $16.34 Tyler-Union
337 |10 INCH MJ SOLID SLEEVE 1 EACH $170.30 TYLER DOMESTIC $162.44 Tyler-Union
338 |10 INCH MJ TEE BOLTS & NUTS 1 EACH $22.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $18.00 EGW
339 |12 INCH BLIND FLANGE 1 EACH $213.20 TYLER DOMESTIC $216.34 Tyler-Union
340 |12 INCH C900 RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $70.45 TYLER DOMESTIC $74.95 Tyler-Union
341 |12 INCH DUCTILE IRON RETAINING GLAND 1 EACH $62.28 TYLER DOMESTIC $66.26 Tyler-Union
342 |12 INCH MJ 22 1/2 BEND 1 EACH $247.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $250.64 Tyler-Union
343 |12 INCH MJ 45 BEND DUCTILE 1 EACH $291.20 TYLER DOMESTIC $285.96 Tyler-Union
344 |12 INCH MJ 90 BEND 1 EACH $366.60 TYLER DOMESTIC $372.00 Tyler-Union
345 |12 INCH MJ SOLID CAP 1 EACH $116.35 TYLER DOMESTIC $118.06 Tyler-Union
346 |12 INCH MJ SPLIT GLAND 1 EACH $19.50 TYLER DOMESTIC $20.74 Tyler-Union
347 |12 INCH MJ SOLID PLUG 1 EACH $130.65 TYLER DOMESTIC $132.57 Tyler-Union
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348 |12 INCH MJ GASKETS 1 EACH $9.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $7.44 Tyler-Union
349 |12 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $34.45 TYLER DOMESTIC $40.00 EGW
350 |12 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $23.36 TYLER DOMESTIC $17.92 Tyler-Union
351 |12 INCH X12 INCH MJ SOLID SLEEVE DI 1 EACH $229.45 TYLER DOMESTIC $232.83 Tyler-Union
352 |12 INCH X10 INCH MJ REDUCER 1 EACH $178.75 TYLER DOMESTIC $181.38 Tyler-Union
353 |12 INCH X 12 INCH X 6 INCH MJ TEE SHORT BODY DI 1 EACH $338.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $342.98 Tyler-Union
354 |12 INCH MJ TEE BOLTS & NUTS 1 EACH $32.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $31.38 Tyler-Union
355 |16 INCH X 15 INCH MJ SOLID SLEEVE 1 EACH $577.20 TYLER DOMESTIC $585.70 Tyler-Union
356 |16 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $59.80 TYLER DOMESTIC $65.00 EGW
357 |24 INCH X 15 INCH MJ SOLID SLEEVE 1 EACH $1,276.60 TYLER DOMESTIC $1,295.40 Tyler-Union
358 |24 INCH MJ GLAND PAKS 1 EACH $143.00 TYLER DOMESTIC $100.00 EGW
359 |24 INCH FLANGE PAKS 1 EACH $126.00 VARIES $100.00 EGW
360 |[1.5 INCH CAST IRON CLEANOUT EXTENSION 1 EACH $161.90 BHFI $172.23 Bass & Hays
361 [1.5INCH X 30 INCH PLASTIC MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $45.00 LADTECH $25.00 Ladtech
362 [1.5INCH X 30 INCH CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH NA $18.00 Turner Co
363 [11/2 INCH MANHOLE EXTENTION W/LID (400 SERIES) 1 EACH $460.55 BHFI $489.95 Bass & Hays
364 |11/2 INCH MANHOLE EXTENSION LOCK DOWN 1 EACH $290.80 BHFI $25.00 Ladtech
365 [11/2 INCH PLASTIC MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $33.00 LADTECH $25.00 Ladtech
366 |1824-S VALVE BOX LID ONLY 1 EACH $21.80 BHFI $12.80 Tyler-Union
367 |18 INCH -24 INCH ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX W/LID 1 EACH $98.80 BHFI $73.46 Tyler-Union
368 |18 INCH -24 INCH TOP ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX 1 EACH $35.65 BHFI $33.02 Tyler-Union
369 |1 INCH VALVE BOX EXTENSION 1 EACH $20.37 BHFI $22.14 Bass & Hays
370 |24 INCH -36 INCH ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX W/LID 1 EACH $119.71 BHFI $101.09 Tyler-Union
371 |24 INCH CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $300.00 VARIES $150.00 Turner Co
372 |24 INCH -48 INCH TOP ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX 1 EACH $43.97 BHFI $48.52 Tyler-Union
373 |2 INCH MANHOLE EXTENTION BOLT DOWN FOR 400 LB U 1 EACH $307.92 BHFI $327.57 Bass & Hays
374 |2 INCH PLASTIC MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $33.00 LADTECH $25.00 Ladtech
375 |2 INCH X 30 INCH PLASTIC MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $45.00 LADTECH $25.00 Ladtech
376 |2 INCH X 30 INCH CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $16.48 VARIES $22.00 Turner Co
377 |STANDARD 300# MANHOLE LID 1 EACH $135.10 BHFI $143.72 Bass & Hays
378 [300-24 MANHOLE LID WATER 1 EACH $135.10 BHFI $143.72 Bass & Hays
379 |STANDARD 300-24 MANHOLE RING W/LID 1 EACH $284.21 BHFI $302.35 Bass & Hays
380 |36 INCH -60 INCH ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX W/LID 1 EACH $175.46 BHFI $147.59 Tyler-Union
381 |36 INCH TO 60 INCH TOP ADJUSTABLE VALVE BOX 1 EACH $78.91 BHFI $75.48 Tyler-Union
382 |36 INCH CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $450.00 VARIES $256.67 Turner Co
383 |3 INCH CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $30.00 VARIES $19.00 Turner Co
384 |3 INCH MANHOLE EXTENTIONS 1 EACH $370.66 BHFI $150.00 Bass & Hays
385 |3 INCH PLASTIC MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $53.00 LADTECH $41.50 Ladtech
386 |3 INCH X 30 INCH PLASTIC MAHOLE RISER 1 EACH $53.00 LADTECH $41.50 Ladtech
387 |3 INCH X 30 INCH CONCRETE MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $19.96 VARIES $30.46 Turner Co
388 |3 INCH VALVE BOX EXTENSION 1 EACH $35.31 BHFI $38.38 Bass & Hays
389 |3 INCH X 30 INCH MANHOLE EXTENTION 1 EACH $370.66 BHFI $402.89 Bass & Hays
390 |400#HEAVY DUTY MANHOLE LID 1 EACH $166.75 BHFI $181.25 Bass & Hays
391 [400-24 MANHOLE LID WATER 1 EACH $166.75 BHFI $181.25 Bass & Hays
392  |400# HEAVY DUTY MANHOLE W/LID 1 EACH $335.46 BHFI $364.63 Bass & Hays
393 |4 INCH CONCRETE MANHOLE RISERS 1 EACH $23.50 VARIES $35.22 Turner Co
394 |4 INCH PLASTIC MANHOLE RISER 1 EACH $53.00 LADTECH $50.00 Ladtech
395 |CAST IRON CLEANOUT BOOT W/LID 1 EACH $187.42 BHFI $203.72 Bass & Hays
396 |CAST IRON CLEANOUT BOOT LID 1 EACH $21.00 BHFI $22.83 Bass & Hays
397 |CLEANOUT LID CAST IRON OBLONG 1 EACH $19.32 BHFI $21.00 AB&I
398 |PRESSURE MANHOLE RING W/LID 1 EACH $450.26 BHFI $489.41 Bass & Hays
399 [VALVE BOX W/LID 340-1 1 EACH $61.07 BHFI $71.29 Bass & Hays
400 [VALVE BOX LIDS 1 EACH $17.61 BHFI $13.00 Bass & Hays
401 [340-1 VALVE BOX LIDS 1 EACH $17.61 BHFI $18.73 Bass & Hays
402 [30 INCH #400 HINGED LOCKING RING & LID 1 EACH $587.10 BHFI $624.57 Bass & Hays
Total Cast Iron Fittings $23,372.14 $22,485.90
Other

403 |Percentage Discount for Items not Specified (Example | 2000 | % —5.00°o| S 1,900.00 —30.00°o| S 1,400.00
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