
CONCRETE SUPPLIES

BID #15150

Item # Item Description QTY Unit Unit Cost Total

01 1x4x16' Construction Heart Redwood 300 each 12.75$        3,825.00$   

02 1x6x16' Construction Heart Redwood 300 each 18.50$        5,550.00$   

03 1x8x16' Construction Heart Redwood 300 each 26.85$        8,055.00$   

04 12"x16' Smooth Lap Siding 200 each 10.95$        2,190.00$   

05 1x4x10' Felt Expansion Joint Material 300 each 2.15$          645.00$      

06 1x12x10' Felt Expansion Joint Material 300 each 3.85$          1,155.00$   

07 1x8x24 Curb Ears 400 each 4.50$          1,800.00$   

08 6" Bar Ties 20 roll 26.50$        530.00$      

09 4" Bar Ties 20 roll 20.15$        403.00$      

10 4-1/4" Chairs for Steel 200 per bag 40 bag 30.50$        1,220.00$   

11 2-1/4" Chairs for steel 200 per bag 40 bag 16.25$        650.00$      

12 White Curing Compound 5 gallon bucket 200 bucket 38.50$        7,700.00$   

13 1x2x18" Wood Stakes 50 per bundle 250 bundle 8.75$          2,187.50$   

14 1x2x30" Wood Stakes 50 per bundle 250 bundle 14.75$        3,687.50$   

15 2x4x16' Spruce Pine Fir (SPF) #2 or better 200 each 6.40$          1,280.00$   

16 2x6x16' Spruce Pine Fir (SPF) #2 or better 200 each 8.50$          1,700.00$   

17 2x8x16' Spruce Pine Fir (SPF) #2 or better 200 each 8.90$          1,780.00$   

18 1x4x16' Yellow Pine #2 300 each 5.25$          1,575.00$   

19 1x12x16' Yellow Pine #2 300 each 13.50$        4,050.00$   

20 #16 Penny Nails 50 lbs. per box 5 box 36.00$        180.00$      

21 #8 Penny Nails 50 lbs. per box 5 box 36.00$        180.00$      

22 #6 Penny Nails 50 lbs. per box 5 box 35.00$        175.00$      

23 Baker Brooms 6' 20 each 196.00$      3,920.00$   

24 Asphalt Crack Sealant - 1 gallon containers 682 gallon 19.50$        13,299.00$ 

25 Items not listed (% discount) 1 % 10% 1,000.00$   

List Mfg Sold

TOTAL $ 68,737.00$ 

City/State

Vendor Name

Contact

Phone

Email

Craddock Lumber

Beau Morton

214-631-5200

sales@craddocklumber.com

Dallas, TX

mailto:sales@craddocklumber.com


Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

22.00$        6,600.00$   -$            No bid

26.00$        7,800.00$   -$            No bid

32.00$        9,600.00$   -$            No bid

19.45$        3,890.00$   -$            8.75$          1,750.00$   

8.93$          2,679.00$   -$            4.40$          1,320.00$   

21.90$        6,570.00$   -$            12.95$        3,885.00$   

10.48$        4,192.00$   -$            6.95$          2,780.00$   

24.00$        480.00$      -$            24.50$        490.00$      

18.00$        360.00$      -$            20.50$        410.00$      

33.00$        1,320.00$   -$            24.00$        960.00$      

19.00$        760.00$      -$            6.00$          240.00$      

29.40$        5,880.00$   -$            26.25$        5,250.00$   

8.48$          2,120.00$   -$            8.00$          2,000.00$   

18.22$        4,555.00$   -$            15.00$        3,750.00$   

6.99$          1,398.00$   -$            No bid

10.23$        2,046.00$   -$            No bid

16.96$        3,392.00$   -$            No bid

5.92$          1,776.00$   -$            5.75$          1,725.00$   

15.77$        4,731.00$   -$            29.50$        8,850.00$   

41.00$        205.00$      -$            36.00$        180.00$      

41.00$        205.00$      -$            36.00$        180.00$      

43.00$        215.00$      -$            36.00$        180.00$      

212.00$      4,240.00$   -$            133.00$      2,660.00$   

19.88$        13,558.16$ -$            14.00$        9,548.00$   

17-40% 1,000.00$   1,000.00$   1,000.00$   

$ 89,572.16$ $ 67,084.38$ $ 47,158.00$ 

No forms returnedno bid sheet returned

NON RESPONSIVE

bill@simbaindustries.com kelly.bowan@cmc.com

Grapevine, TX Fort Worth, TX

NON RESPONSIVE

Simba Industries CMC

WF Kasten Kelly Bowen

817-251-4800 817-838-6811

Barnsco

James Schuessler

214-352-9091

jamess@barnsco.com

Dallas, TX

mailto:bill@simbaindustries.com
mailto:kelly.bowan@cmc.com
mailto:jamess@barnsco.com

