VET CLINIC SUPPLY STOCK Vendor:
BID SHEET ~ RFB # 15147 Contact:
The annual estimated dollar value of this contract shall be $150,000. Annual Email:
estimated quantities are not known and vary from year to year. Phone:
City/State:
ITEM DESC. UOM
Ear Meds ]
Acarexx (0.01% ivermectin) box of 12 BX
Animax Ointment or Panalog or Quadritop 30ml EA
Miconazole Lotion 60ml bottle BO
Mometamax 6 x 30gm BX
Otibiotic 10gm bottle EA
Otibiotic 15gm bottle EA
Otibiotic 25gm bottle EA
Synotic 8ml bottle BO
Tresaderm 12 x 7.5ml BX
Eye Meds
Atropine 1% Drops 5ml bottle BO
B.N.P. Qintment (Neo-Poly-Bac) 3.5gm EA
Gentamicin Drops 5ml bottle BO
Neo-Poly-Dex Ointment 3.5gm EA
Neo-Poly-Dex drops 5ml bottle EA
Proparacaine Drops 15ml bottle BO
Puralube Ointment 3.5gm EA
Terramycin Qintment 3.5gm EA
Tobramycin Drops 5ml bottle BO
Antifungals
Fluconazole 50mg Tablets 30ct bottle BO
Fluconazole 100mg Tablets 30ct bottle BO
Fluconazole 200mg Tablets 30ct bottle BO
Griseofulvin 125mg/5ml 120ml bottle BO
Itraconazole 100mg Capsules 30ct bottle BO
Ketoconazole 200mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Miconazole Cream 10z tube TB
Digestive
Chlorpromazine 10mg 100ct bottle BO
Chlorpromazine 25mg 100ct bottle BO
Famotidine 10mg 70ct bottle BO
Famotidine 20mg 100ct bottle BO
Famotidine 40mg 100ct bottle BO
Lactulose 10gm/ml 160z. Bottle BO




Loperamide 2mg 100ct bottle BO
Loperamide Liquid 40z. Bottle BO
Metoclopramide 5mg 100ct bottle BO
Metoclopramide 10mg 500ct bottle BO
Pro-Pectalin Paste 30ml BO
Pro-Pectalin Tabs 250ct BO
Sucralfate 1gm 100ct bottle BO
Allergy - ]

Chlorpheniramine Maleate 4mg Tablets 1000ct bottle BO
Diphenhydramine 25mg 100ct bottle BO
Diphenhydramine 50mg 100ct bottle BO
Triamcinolone Topical Spray 160z. Bottle

BO
Triamcinolone 10 mg/ml injectable 5 mL bottle BO
Gentamicin betamethasone 120ml bottle BO
Prednisone 5mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Prednisone 10mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Prednisone 20mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO

Antibiotics ]

Amoxicillin 250mg 100ct bottle BO
Amoxicillin 500mg 100ct bottle BO
Cefpodoxime 100mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Cefpodoxime 200mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Cephalexin 250mg Capsules 500ct bottle BO
Cephalexin 500mg Capsules 500ct bottle BO
Cefovectin Sodium 80mg/ml inj 10 mL bottle BO
Ciprofloxacine 250mg 100ct bottle BO
Ciprofloxacine 500mg 100ct bottle BO
Ciprofloxacine 750mg 50ct bottle BO
Clavamox Drops 15ml bottle 15ml bottle BO
Clavamox 62.5mg Tablets 210ct box BX
Clavamox 125mg Tablets 210ct box BX
Clavamox 250mg Tablets 210ct box BX
Clavamox 375mg Tablets 210ct box BX
Clindamycin 25mg Tablets or Capsules 200 ct bottle

BO
Clindamycin 75mg Tablets or Capsules 200ct bottle BO




Clindamycin 150mg Tablets or Capsules 100ct bottle BO
Clindamycin Drops 25mg/ml 20ml bottle BO
Doxycycline 100mg Tablets 250ct bottle BO
Enrofloxacin 22.7mg 500ct bottle BO
Enrofloxacin 68mg 250 ct bottle BO
Enrofloxacin 136mg NOT 100mg 200 ct bottle BO
Metronidazole 250mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Metronidazole 500mg Tablets 500ct bottle BO
Orbifloxacin 5.7mg Tablets 250ct bottle BO
Orbifloxacin 22.7mg Tablets 250ct bottle BO
Orbifloxacin 68mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
SMZ-TMP 250mg/ml Liquid 473 mL bottle BO
SMZ-TMP 480mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
SMZ-TMP 960mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Heart, Lungs, Blood Pressure
Atenolol 25mg 100 ct bottle BO
Atenolol 50mg 100 ct bottle BO
Benazepril 5mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Enalapril 2.5mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Enalapril 5mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Enalapril 10mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Enalapril 20mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Furosemide 12.5mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Furosemide 20mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Furosemide 50mg Tabs 100 ct bottle BO
Theophylline 100mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Theophylline 200mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Vetmedin 1.25mg 50ct bottle BO
Vetmedin 5mg 50ct bottle BO
Pain ]
Carprofen 25mg Tablets 180ct bottle BO
Carprofen 75mg Tablets 180ct bottle BO
Carprofen 100mg Tablets 180ct bottle BO
Meloxicam 7.5mg Tablets 1000ct bottle BO
Meloxicam Oral Suspension 0.5mg/ml 30ml bottle BO




Meloxicam Oral Suspension 1.5mg/ml

100ml bottle

BO
Methocarbamol 500mg Tablets 500ct bottle BO
Onsior 6mg Tablets 30ct box BO

Dewormers I B

Droncit Canine or equal 50ct bottle BO
Droncit Feline 50ct bottle EA
Drontal Plus 22.7mg 50ct bottle BO
Drontal Plus 68mg 50ct bottle BO
Drontal Plus 136mg 30ct bottle BO
Marquis Paste tube TB
Panacur Granules 11b jar EA
Panacur Liquid 100mg/ml 1000ml bottle BO
Profender Sm 20ct box BX
Profender Md 20ct box BX
Profender Lg 20ct box BX
Pyrantel Pamoate 320z bottle BO

Shampoos, Ear Cleaners, Dips

EpiOtic Advanced

80z. Bottle

Skunk Off Shampoo 80z. Bottle 28
TrizEDTA 40z. Bottle BO
VetSolutions Aloe & Oatmeal 160z. Bottle BO
VetSolutions Aloe & Oatmeal 1 gallon BO
VetSolutions BPO 3% 160z. Bottle BO
VetSolutions BPO 3% 1 gallon BO
VetSolutions Ear Cleansing Solution 80z. Bottle BO
VetSolutions Ear Cleansing Solution 1 gallon BO
VetSolutions Lime Sulfur Dip 40z. Bottle BO
VetSolutions Sebozole 160z. Bottle BO
VetSolutions Sebozole 1 gallon BO
VetSolutions Universal Medicated Shampoo 160z. Bottle

BO




VetSolutions Universal Medicated Shampoo

1 gallon

BO
Miscellaneous Meds/Supplements
Acepromazine 10mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Acepromazine 25mg Tablets 100ct bottle BO
Activated Charcoal Toxiban granules- 11b BO
Calcium Gluconate 10ml bottle BO
Cough Tablets 1000ct bottle BO
Enema Dog 12 x 12ml BX
Enema Cat 12 x 6ml BX
Maropitant Citrate 10mg/ml injectable 20ml bottle BO
Pet-tinic 1 gallon BO
Injectables

Acepromazine 10mg/ml 50ml bottle BO
Acetylcysteine 20% 30ml bottle BO
Ampicillin 1gm injectable BO
Anzemet 100mg/5ml 20 mg/mL bottle BO
Atipamazole (Antisedan) 10ml bottle BO
Atropine Sulfate 1/120grain 100ml bottle BO
Bupivicaine 5Smg/ml 100ml bottle BO
Carprofen (50mg/ml) 20ml bottle BO
Cefazolin 1gm injectable BO
Dectomax 100ml bottle BO
Depo Medrol 20mg 20ml bottle BO
Depo Medrol 40mg 5ml bottle BO
Dex SP 100ml bottle BO
Dexamethasone 100ml bottle BO
Dexmetdetomidine (Dexdomitor) 10ml bottle BO
Diphenhydramine 50mg/ml 25ct package PK
Doxapram 20mg/mi 20ml bottle BO
Epinephrine 30ml bottle BO
Furosemide 50ml bottle BO
Glycopyrrolate 0.2mg/ml 20ml bottle BO
Heparin 1000units/ml 10 mL bottle BO
Ivermectin 1% 500ml bottle BO




Lidocaine

100ml bottle

BO
Meloxicam or Meloxidyl 10ml bottle BO
Metoclopramide 5Smg/ml 160z. Bottle BO
Naloxone 10ml bottle BO
Penicillin G 250ml bottle BO
Potassium Chloride 20ml bottle BO
Praziquantel 56.8mg/ml 50ml bottle BO
Propofol 28  200mg/20mL 20 mL bottle BO
Solu Delta Cortef 100mg/10ml 10ml bottle BO
Vetalog 2mg/ml 100ml bottle BO
Vitamin B Complex 250ml bottle BO
Vitamin B12 100ml bottle BO
Vitamin K1 100ml bottle BO
Xylazine 100mg/ml 50ml bottle BO
Xylazine 20mg/mi 20ml bottle BO
Yohimbine 2mg/ml 20ml bottle BO

Controlled Drugs

Buprenorphine 0.3mg/ml

Multi-use vial if available,

box of 10 ampules if not BX
Butorphenol 10mg/ml bottle BO
Controlled Substance Record Book Single record EA
Diazepam 5mg/ml case of 10, 10ml bottles CA
Ketamine 100mg/ml 10ml bottle BO
Morphine 15mg/ml 20ml bottle BO
Telazol 100mg/ml 5ml bottle BO
Tramadol 50mg Tablets 500ct bottle BO
Anesthesia

. Rubber 0.5L Non-
Anesthesia Bags Rebreather EA
Anesthesia Bags Rubber 0.5L EA
Anesthesia Bags Rubber 1.0L EA
Anesthesia Bags Rubber 2.0L EA
Anesthesia Bags Rubber 3.0L EA
Anesthesia Bags Rubber 4.0L EA

Anesthesia Masks- Sm Canine Cone_ masks with
diaphragm EA

Anesthesia Masks- Md Canine Cone_ masks with
diaphragm EA




Anesthesia Masks- Lg Canine

Cone masks with

diaphragm EA
. . Cone masks with
Anesthesia Masks- Lg Feline diaphragm EA
Baralyme / Sodalime 37 Ib bag EA
Bionet SPO2 Cable EA
Blood Pressure Cuff #1 EA
Blood Pressure Cuff #2 EA
Blood Pressure Cuff #3 EA
Blood Pressure Cuff #4 EA
Blood Pressure Cuff #5 EA
Endotracheal Tubes 3.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 3.5mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 4.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 4.5mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 5.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 5.5mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 6.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 6.5mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 7.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 7.5mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 8.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 8.5mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 9.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 9.5mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 10.0mm EA
Endotracheal Tubes 10.5mm EA
ET Tube Cleaner Brush 4mm EA
ET Tube Cleaner Brush 8mm EA
ET Tube Rack Holds ET tubes on wall EA
F Circuits Anesthesia circuit EA
Induction Chamber JorVet
EA
Isoflurane 250ml bottle BO
Isoflurane Anti-Spill device each EA
Laryngoscope Handle EA
Laryngoscope Blade 66 MM EA
Laryngoscope Blade 110MM EA
Non-rebreathing circuits Anesthesia circuit EA
Oximax N-65 Handheld Pulse Oximeter or
Pulse Ox
comparable EA
Stylet For small endotracheal
tubes EA




Instrument Sterilization

Autoclave Cleaner

Tuttnauer Chamber Bright

BO
Autoclave Pouches- Self seal 3x9- 200ct PK
Autoclave Pouches- Self seal 5.25x10- 200ct PK
Autoclave Pouches- Self seal 7.5x13- 200ct PK
Brush w/ Nylon Bristles To clean instruments EA
Brush w/ Stainless Steel Bristles To clean instruments EA
Instrument Enzymatic Cleaner Miltex ez-zyme EA
Instrument Milk Spectra-lube EA
Sterilization Indicator Tape 1/2" wide x 60yd long EA
Sterilization Strip Indicators 250ct PK
Sterilization Wraps 30x30 Fabric, washable EA
Ultrasonic Cleansing Solution 1 gallon BO

Examination

Digital Thermometers each EA
Exam Stool- Roller Type each

EA
Muzzles- Canine Sizes xs EA
Muzzles- Canine sizes s EA
Muzzles- Canine sizesm EA
Muzzles- Canine sizes | EA
Muzzles- Canine sizes Xl EA
Muzzles- Canine sizes xxl| EA
Muzzles- Canine sizes xxxl|

eA
Muzzles- Feline sizes s EA
Muzzles- Feline sizesm EA
Muzzles- Feline sizes | EA
Nitrile Exam Gloves - SMALL 100 ct box BX
Nitrile Exam Gloves - MEDIUM 100 ct box BX
Nitrile Exam Gloves - LARGE 100 ct box BX
Stethoscope Littman Cardiology Il EA
Table-top Small Animal Scale w/ LCD Display VSSI EA
Thermometer Probe Covers Nexcare EA
Ultrasound Gel each EA
Walk-on Floor Scale each EA
Welch Allyn Coaxial Opthal Set w/ Pneumatic Opthalmoscope/Otoscope
Oto, Rechargeable Handle w/ Hard Case set ST

Laboratory

AlphaTrak Meter Strips Glucose Strips EA




Blood Collection Tubes

EDTA, 1.3ml Lavendar,

Screw top- 100ct EA
Dip Quick Kit- Refill Stains EA
Disposable Transfer Pipettes 1.7ml- 50ct PK
Fecal Loops- Adult 100ct PK
Fecal Loops- Puppy/Kitten 100ct PK
Fecatect Fecal floatation medium-
1 gallon BO
Fecatectors Fecal float containers-
50ct PK
Fecatectors- Refills 50ct BG
Fluorescein Stain Strips 100ct BO
Glass Coplin Jars w/ Lids each EA
Glass Cover Slips 10z box BX
Hematocrit Tube Clay each EA
Hematocrit Tubes- Red Heparinized- 100ct EA
Immersion Oil 120ml bottle BO
Kim Wipes box BX
Microscope Lens Cleaning Solution bottle BO
Mineral Qil 1 gallon BO
Schirmer Tear Test Strips pkg PK
Slides- Clear pkg PK
Slides- Frosted pkg PK
Urinalysis Strips Urispec 11-way PK
Urine Collection Cat Litter Granules bottle BO
Urine Sediment Stain bottle

Surgery
35W Appose Stapler each EA
Bouffant Caps 21"- 500ct BO
Disposable Cautery Battery Operated EA
Ear Loop Face Masks 50ct PK
Gigli Wire- Ortho 21" EA
Gigli Wire Handles pair PR
Instrument Stand Mayo type EA
. 13qt stainless steel on
Kick Buckets wheels EA
Lap Sponges 12"x12"- 5c¢t PK
Penrose Tubing 7/16x1/4x12" EA
Penrose Tubing 1/2x5/16x12" EA
Penrose Tubing 5/8x3/9x12" EA




Penrose Tubing 3/4x1/2x12" EA
Penrose Tubing 1.25x3/4x12" EA
Scrub Brush- EZ Scrub each EA
Scrub Brush- Surgeon each EA
Surgery Gowns- Fabric M EA
Surgery Gowns- Fabric L EA
Surgery Gowns- Fabric XL EA
Surgery Needles, 3/8ctg size #10 PK
Surgery Needles, 3/8ctg size #12 PK
Surgery Needles, 3/8ctg size #14 PK
Surgery Needles, 3/8ctg size #16 PK
Light blue cotton, 17"
Surgery Towels 33" EA
Surgical Blades #10- 100ct PK
Surgical Blades #15- 100ct PK
Surgical Drapes EJAY cloth 30")_(30" w/ 4"
fenestration EA
Surgical Drapes EJAY cloth 30"x30't w/
7"x 1-1/4" fenestration EA
Surgical Drapes EJAY cloth 40")_(40" w/ 4"
fenestration EA
Surgical Drapes EJAY cloth 40"x40‘_‘ w/
7"x1-1/4" fenestration EA
Surgical Gloves 6.5 PR
Surgical Gloves 7 PR
Surgical Gloves 7.5 PR
Surgical Gloves 8 PR
Surgical Gloves 8.5 PR
Surgical Gloves 9 PR
Suture Cassette Holder EA
Suture, Monofilament Absorbable size 1 cassette
EA
Suture, Monofilament Absorbable size 0 casette EA
Suture, Monofilament Absorbable size 2-0 cassette EA
Suture, Monofilament Absorbable size 3-0 cassette EA
Suture, Monosorb #0 BX
Suture, Monosorb size 2-0 BX
Suture, Monosorb size 3-0 BX
Tattoo Ink- Black 30z EA
Tattoo Marker Complete Electronic w/ Case Tattoo kit EA
Tie-On Face Masks 50ct PK
Tissue Glue 3M Vetbond BO
Yankauer Handle Tip each EA




Grooming ]
#40 Blades each EA
Blade Wash bottle BO
Clipper Spray Disinfectant bottle BO
Andis- Super Cordless
Cordless, Rechargeable Clipper Set (Surgery VetPack Complete Kit
quality) with Two Batteries, #40
Blade Set & Case EA
Grooming Comb each EA
Heavy Duty Dog Nail Trimmers Small EA
Heavy Duty Dog Nail Trimmers Large EA
Kool Lube each EA
Kwik-Stop w/Benzocaine EA
Silver Nitrate Sticks each EA
Slicker Brush each EA

Fluid Therapy

Dextrose 50%

500mlI bottle

BO
IV Catheters 24g Terumo SURFLO
EA
IV Catheters 229 Terumo SURFLO EA
IV Catheters 20g Terumo SURFLO EA
IV Catheters 18g Terumo SURFLO
EA
IV Extension Set 30" ST
IV Set 10drops/ml Hospira Prl_mary IV set or
equivalent ST
IV Set 15drops/ml Hospira Prl_mary IV set or
equivalent ST
IV Set 60drops/ml Hospira Prl_mary IV set or
equivalent ST
Lactated Ringers Solution 1 Liter EA
Physiological Saline 250ml bottle
BO
Pressure Infusor 1 Liter

BO




Sodium Chloride 0.9% 1 Liter

BO
Sterile Water 250ml bottle BO
SURFLO Injection Plug Luer lock

EA
T-Connectors Macro

EA
T-Connectors Micro

EA
Apron Rack each

EA
Aprons each EA
Badge Service each EA
Barrium Sulfate bottle BO
Calipers each EA
Film Blocker each EA
Hand Shields each EA
Thyroid Collars each EA
X-ray Markers L &R set ST

Dentistry ]

Dental Bur Kit each

EA
Disposable Polishing Heads To fit VetPro 1000 EA
Extracting Forceps each EA
Fluoride Foam bottle BO
Mouth Gags- Canine Small EA
Mouth Gags- Canine Medium EA
Mouth Gags- Canine Large EA
Mouth Gags- Feline one size EA
Periodontal Instrument Kit each EA
Prophy Paste Jar BO
Safety Glasses pair PR
Winged Elevator Kit kit KT

Surgical Instruments _

#3 Scalpel Handle Miltex or comparable EA
Allis Tissue Forceps 6" 4x5 Teeth Miltex or comparable EA




Backhaus Towel Clamps 3-1/2" Miltex or comparable EA
Brown-Adson Forceps 4-3/4" 7x7 Teeth Miltex or comparable EA
Halsted Mosquito Forceps 5" Curved Miltex or comparable EA
Halsted Mosquito Forceps 5" Straight Miltex or comparable EA
Kelly Forceps 5-1/2" Curved Miltex or comparable EA
Mayo Scissors 6-3/4" Straight Miltex or comparable PR
Metzenbaum Scissors 7" Curved Miltex or comparable PR
Miltex Feline Spay Packs Miltex EA

Olsen-Hagar Needle Holder 5-1/2"

Miltex or comparable

EA

Rochester-Carmalt Forceps 6-1/4" Curved Miltex or comparable EA

Snook Ovariectomy Hook Miltex or comparable EA
. Miltex-Silitone bands, 12

Surgical Instrument Markers colors, 40 of each PK

Tissue Forceps 5-1/2" 1x2 Teeth

Miltex or comparable EA

Miscellaneous Items

Alcohol 70% 1 gallon BO
Alcohol Dispenser each EA
Amber Bottles- Plastic 1 0z each EA
Amber Bottles- Plastic 2 0z. each EA
Bandage Scissors pair PR
Betadine 1 gallon BO
Blood Collection Bag Jorvet J-520 BG
Blood Set Interlink 77" Straight ST
Bottle Closures 50ct PK
Braided Leashes 12-pk PK
Cast Padding 2"x4yd EA
Cast Padding 3"x4yd EA
Cetylcide Il 32 0z bottle EA
Chlorhexidine Scrub 1 gallon BO
Chlorhexidine Solution 1 gallon BO
Cotton Balls Medium- 1000ct PK
Cotton Rolls 11b. PK
Cotton-Tipped Wood Shaft 6" Swabs- 100ct PK
E-Collars 7.5cm Plastic w/ tab fasteners EA
E-Collars 10cm Plastic w/ tab fasteners EA
E-Collars 12.5cm Plastic w/ tab fasteners EA
E-Collars 15cm Plastic w/ tab fasteners EA
E-Collars 20cm Plastic w/ tab fasteners EA
E-Collars 25cm Plastic w/ tab fasteners EA
E-Collars 30cm Plastic w/ tab fasteners EA
Elasticon 2"- 6ct PK




Eye Wash System each EA
Formalin gallon BO
Gauze- Woven 3x3, 4 ply PK
Gauze, Bandage Roll 2" Roll RL
Gauze, Bandage Roll 4" Roll RL
Gauze, Conforming Stretch 2" EA
Gel Foam bottle BO
Hair Roller w/ Handle and Refills each EA
Hydrogen Peroxide 1 gallon BO
Jar- Applicators Sundry, Labeled EA
Jar- Bandages Sundry, Labeled EA
Jar- Cotton Sundry, Labeled EA
Jar- Gauze Sundry, Labeled EA
Jar- Tongue Depressors Sundry, Labeled EA
Jars Sundry, Unlabeled EA
KMR Kitten Powder 12 oz. BO
Laxatone Tuna Flavor BO
Light Bulbs Halogen Surgery Light EA
Mesh Gauze 1"- 180ct PK
Non-Spermicidal Lube Flip top EA
Nutrical tube EA
OB Sleeves disposable, box BX
Pill Bottles 8 1/2 dram 150 ct BX
Pill Bottles 20 dram 150 ct BX
Pill Cutters each EA
Pill Guns Rubber tip EA
Pill Pocket Treats or Comparable 10ct PK
Porous Tape 1" x 10yd, 12 ct box BX
Sharps Containers Medium EA
Sovereign Feeding Tubes Varying Sizes EA
Splint Plastic Meta 1"x8" Sm EA
Splint Plastic Meta 1/2"x12" Md EA
Sponges- Non-Woven 4x4, 4 ply case CS
Staple Remover each EA
Sterile Empty Vials 30ml box BX
Stockinet 1"x25yd EA
Stockinet 2"x25yd EA
Stockinet 3"x25yd EA
Stockinet 4"x25yd EA
Stockinet 6"x25yd EA
Stockinet 8'"'x25yd EA
Stomach Tube Speculum Canine EA
Stomach Tube Speculum Feline EA




Suture Removal Scissors pair PR
Syringe Caps- Luer Slip 100 ct BX
Tom Cat Catheter Open-ended EA
Tongue Depressors 6", 500ct box BX
Tourniquets each EA
Trigger Sprayer 16 oz. BO
VetWrap 2" EA
VetWrap 4" EA
Vial Adapter- Universal Dual-Vent EA
Waterproof Tape 1"x 10yd, 12 ct box PK
Wet Pack Tray w/ Lid each EA
Yesterday's News 30 Ib. PK
Yorker Bottles 10z. BO
Yorker Bottles 16 oz. EA

Needles/Syringes

Needles- Nipro 18g x 1" box- 100ct BX
Needles- Nipro 20g x 1" box- 100ct BX
Needles- Nipro 229 x 3/4" box- 100ct BX
Needles- Nipro 25g x 5/8" box- 100ct BX
Syringes- 12ml curved tip 100 ct box BX
Syringes 12ml with Luer Lock Monoject veterinary; rigid
autoclavable (box of 80) BX
. Terumo or equal (box of
Syringes 1ml w/ Needle 100) BX
. Terumo or equal (box of
Syringes 1ml w/o Needle 100) BX
Syringes 20ml with Luer Lock Monoject veterinary; rigid
autoclavable (box of 50)
BX
: . I Monoject veterinary; rigid
Syringes 20ml with Slip Tip autoclavable (box of 50) BX
. . Monoject veterinary; rigid
Syringes 35ml with Luer Lock autoclavable BX
. . Monoject veterinary; rigid
Syringes 3ml w/ 229 x 3/4" Needle autoclavable (box of 100) .
. Monoject veterinary; rigid
Syringes 60ml Luer Lock autoclavable BX

Syringes 6ml with Luer Lock

Monoject veterinary; rigid
autoclavable (box of 50)

EA




. . A Monoject veterinary; rigid
Syringes 6ml with Slip Tip autoclavable (box of 50) BX
Shelter I B
Accel Concentrate 55 gallon EA
Accel Concentrate 5 gallon EA
Accel RTU 32 0z hottle EA
Accel Wipes 160 count EA
Alcohol 16 0z bottle BO
Aprons Grooming EA
Cat Carriers Case of cardboard boxes EA
Clipper A5 Turbo 2 Spd 10 Bld EA
Clipper Blade Cryox Sz 10 EA
Clipper Blade Ultra Edge Sz10 EA
Clipper Blade Wash 18 0z EA
Clipper Blade Spray Disinfectant 16 oz EA
Clipper Spray Kool Lube 14 0z EA
Clipper Volt Lith+lon Cordless EA
Hydrogen Peroxide 16 0z BO
Hydrogen Peroxide 1 gallon BO
ID Bands- Lg Blue PK
ID Bands- Lg Pink PK
Kwik-Stop Styptic powder 1/2 0z EA
Needles 18g BX
Needles 22gx 1 1/2" BX
Needles 22g x 1" BX
Needles 25¢ x 5/8" BX
Pancreas Powder Plus 12 oz. EA
Pyrantel Pamoate 320z bottle BO
Scalpel Handles Fits 20 blade EA
Sharps Container 14 gt EA
Sharps Container 8 gallon EA
Sharps Container 3.3qt EA
Surgical Blades #20 BX
Syringes 1ml w/ 25g x 5/8" Needle 100/box BX
Syringes 1ml w/o Needle 100/box BX
Syringes 3ml w/ 22g x 1" Needle 100/box BX
Syringes 3ml 22x3/4 LS VPAK 100/box BX




Syringes 5ml no needle

100/box

BX
Tourniquets EA
Urine-Away Soaker 1 gallon BO
Viralys Powder 600 gm EA

Vaccines I

Bordatella 25 x 1 dose EA
DAZ2PP 25 x 1 dose EA
DA2PPL 25 x 1 dose EA
FVRCP 25 x 1 dose EA
FVRCP + FeLV 25 x 1 dose EA
Nobivac 1-Rabies 5 x 10 dose EA
Nobivac 3-Rabies 5 x 10 dose EA

Flea/Tick and Heartworm Preventative

Activyl Plus Aqua

88-132Ib

CT
Activyl Plus Blue 4-111b cT
Activyl Plus Brown 11-221b cT
Activyl Plus Pink 22-441b cT
Activyl Plus Purple 44-88lb cT
Activyl Spot On Navy Over 9lb cT
Activyl Spot On Orange Under 9lb cT
Capstar Blue 2-251b

BX
Capstar Green Over 25Ib

BX
Heartgard Plus Blue Up to 25Ibs

CT




Heartgard Plus Brown

51-100Ib

CT
Heartgard Plus Green 26-501b

CT
Triheart Plus Blue Up to 25lbs

CT
Triheart Plus Green 25-501Ibs

CT
Triheart Plus Brown 51-100 Ibs CT
Vectra 3D Blue 12x6ds 21-55Ib CT
Vectra 3D Gold 12x6ds 5-10Ib CT
Vectra 3D Purple 12x6ds 56-95Ib CT
Vectra 3D Red  12x6ds Over 95Ib CT
Vectra 3D Teal  12x6ds 11-20Ib CT
Vectra Large Cat  12x6ds Over 9lb CT
Vectra Small Cat 12x6ds Under 91b CT
Percentage Discount for Items Not Specified percentage %




Midwest Vet

Henry Schein Animal Health

Julie Burrell

Beth Seeley/Casey Perkins

Julie.burrell@midwestvet.net

biddesk@henryscheinvet.com

952-894-4350

800-282-5162 x5532

Lakerville, MN Dublin, OH 43017
PERCENTAGE MFG PERCENTAGE MFG
DISCOUNT ITEM # DISCOUNT ITEM#
I R R R
Milbemit
0.0% 0% 049267 e
Quadrito
10.8% 10% 006571 p
10.8% 10% 014676
Merck
18.0% 17% 020063 shelter
10.8% 10% 037851
10.8% 10% 037852
10.8% 10% 037853
0.0% 0% 000659
0.0% 0% 041071
- " 71T 7 ]
22.7% 5% 054805 |
22.7% 5% 054780
40.5% 10% 054814
22.7% 4% 054809
22.7% 4% 054810
22.6% 10% 054795
8.4% 2% 008897
0.0% 0% 028983
40.5% 10% 055452
- " 17T 7 ]
16.7% 0% 055386 |
16.7% 0% 055387
16.7% 0% 055388
22.6% no bid
10.7% 2% 051062
10.7% 5% 055068
40.7% 15% 007364 |
I R I R
16.7% 15% 004958
16.7% 15% 004959
28.6% 15% 055734
28.7% 15% 050861
28.8% 15% 050862
22.7% 15% 055029



mailto:Julie.burrell@midwestvet.net
mailto:biddesk@henryscheinvet.com

16.7% 15% 055406
28.8% 15% 004987
28.8% 15% 049140
16.8% 15% 049141
0.0% 0% 031484
0.0% 0% 031485
16.7% 10% 049010 |
- 1 1 7}
28.7% 10% 055460
40.8% 10% 030972
40.8% 10% 055461
NOT
AVAILA
0.0% 0% 021470 BLE
16.7% no bid
10.7% 5% 012741
16.7% 0% 055439 1000's
16.7% 0% 055440
16.7% 0% 055435
28.7% 10% 049113
28.6% 10% 054969
NA 5% 054840
NA 5% 054841
16.7% 12% 049021
16.7% 12% 055032
NA no bid
22.7% 0% 055360
22.7% 0% 055361
22.7% 12% 054865
subj to
0.0% 0% 032548 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 032543 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 032545 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 032546 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 032547 change
NOT
AVAILA
0.0% 0% 033049 BLE
16.7% 12% 055038




22.7% 12% 055362
10.9% 10% 050456
0.0% 10% 055252
8.3% 5% 049535 100's
8.3% 5% 049537 50's
8.3% 5% 049539 50's
16.7% 8% 055500
10.7% 5% 055503
discontin
0.0% no bid ued
Merck
15.0% 15% 013220 shelter
Merck
15.0% 15% 013221 shelter
16.7% 10% 054839
21.3% 10% 049101
22.6% 10% 049076 |
- 1 "1 7}
40.9% 12% 054583
40.7% 0% 032369 add fgt
28.7% 15% 050461
22.7% 0% 055377
16.8% 0% 055381
16.7% 0% 055375
16.7% 0% 055379
Salix
4.8% 0% 001552 500's
79.5% 15% 054960
4.8% 5% 002558 500's
16.7% 17% 048993
16.7% 17% 049032
0.0% 0% 032801
0.0% 0% 032802 |
N I A A I
subj to
0.0% 0% 024743 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 024736 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 024750 change
22.6% 0% 054621 100's
subj to
0.0% 0% 045455 change




subj to

7.1% 0% 050403 change
16.7% 15% 055256
subj to
0.0% 0% 045097 change |
0.0% agency no bid |
0.0% agency no bid
0.0% agency no bid
0.0% agency no bid
0.0% agency no bid
0.0% agency no bid
Merck
15.0% 15% 001557 shelter
0.0% 0% 001555
0.0% agency no bid
0.0% agency no bid
0.0% agency no bid
0.0% 012006 |
substitute |
0.0% 5% 038187 Phytovet
16.8% 12% 012553
8.4% 0% 023754
subj to
0.0% 0% 012609 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 012610 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 031347 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 031346 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 012613 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 012614 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 032191 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 032641 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 032642 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 015450 change




subj to

0.0% 0% 015451 change
10.7% 0% 003846
10.7% 0% 003847
16.7% 10% 004263
28.7% 5% 054873
13.1% 15% 004095
10.8% 10% 009886
16.6% 10% 019976
0.0% no bid
16.6% 10% 006585 |
10.8% 0% 003845 |
disc 0% 054897 3x10ml
16.9% 10% 049162 bx/10
16.7% 0% 026160
subj to
0.0% 0% 034363 change
16.7% 15% 002452
28.8% 15% 054893 50ml size
subj to
0.0% 0% 024751 change
0.0% 10% 054846 backorder
subj to
0.0% 0% 023065 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 002269 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 002245 change
20.3% 6% 002458
9.8% 6% 002459
subj to
0.0% 0% 034362 change
16.7% 15% 055371
NA 12% 055010
10.8% 8% 055069
subj to
0.0% 0% 001551 change
16.7% 0% 055016
28.7% 10% 049130
0.0% no bid




subj to

11.1% 15% 002468 change
10.7% 10% 049755 Eloxiject
28.7% 16% 044148
16.7% 16% 054904
4.1% 10% 022821
28.7% 0% 054884
subj to
10.7% 0% 021498 change
10.7% 6% 040661
subj to
0.0% 0% 002248 change
disc not available
4.8% 15% 038572
5.0% 8% 002492
4.8% 8% 004355 backorder
2.4% 5% 033198
33.4% 5% 033197
16.7% 4% 004675

0.0% 8% 054888 10x1ml
0.0% 5% 055178
0.0% 0% 015621
0.0% 8% 054902
0.0% 15% 045822
0.0% 10% 055009
subj to
0.0% 0% 004866 change
0.0% 9% 050859

20.6% 8% 018304
0.0% 8% 022047
0.0% 8% 022273
0.0% 8% 022048
0.0% 8% 022272
0.0% 8% 022271

10.7% 8% 020464

NA 8% 020461




10.7% 8% 020461
0.0% 8% 020462
0.0% 8% 023839
398.5% no bid
0.0% 15% 044840
0.0% 15% 044841
0.0% 15% 044842
0.0% 15% 044843
0.0% 15% 044844
34.4% 15% 034959
34.4% 15% 007944
34.4% 15% 007945
34.4% 15% 007946
34.4% 15% 001768
34.4% 15% 001769
34.4% 15% 001770
34.4% 15% 001771
34.4% 15% 001772
34.4% 15% 001773
34.4% 15% 001774
34.4% 15% 001775
34.4% 15% 001776
34.4% 15% 001777
34.4% 15% 001778
34.5% 15% 034802
0.0% 8% 030208
0.0% 8% 030209
17.7% 8% 005291
20.7% 5% 013217
Freight
Addition
4.6% 0% 012263 al
10.7% 5% 050033
10.7% 8% 008959
20.6% 10% 016638
0.0% 10% 016636 80mm
0.0% 10% 016637 130mm
0.0% 10% 004656
NA no bid
20.7% 10% 022043




Speedcle
29.0% 5% 012588 an
15.7% 20% 037274 3.5x9
16.7% 20% 037275
9.6% 20% 037277
28.7% 15% 009908
28.6% 15% 008771
28.6% 10% 024176
private
38.1% 12% 014325 label
16.7% 18% 037281
16.7% 18% 001671
10.8% 12% 002994
20.6% 17% 037646 |
- 17 [ 7}
28.6% 4% 021001
Freight
Addition
NA 5% 004285 al
17.1% 12% 016083 set of 7
27.1% 12% 003626 set of 3
24.5% 15% 032784
10.4% 15% 032785
15.1% 15% 032786
22.7% 5% 016939
Freight
Addition
17.2% 5% 035133 al
16.8% 5% 008794 pk/50
27.8% 17% 021988
16.8% 5% 023827
17.9% 15% 005169 |
17 5% .
17.9% 0% 043244
16.7% 15% 011196
10.5% 15% 006442
17.1% 15% 022963
38.2% 15% 032435
17.0% 15% 032441
NA 15% 029905
e TR
10.7% 15% 031570




0.0% 10% 054779
20.6% 10% 040805
0.0% 15% 010087
20.7% 10% 019430
20.7% 12% 019339
16.8% 12% 006448
20.6% 6% 023678
0.0% 12% 023625
20.7% 5% 007404
0.0% 12% 043278
20.4% 12% 010088
20.7% 12% 010089
20.7% 12% 035648
0.0% 10% 033602
38.2% 12% 014648 |
203% S .
10.8% 4% 020388 |
0.0% 12% 032650
31.2% 12% 016435
30.0% 15% 037893
16.7% 12% 016333
16.7% 12% 016336
Freight
Addition
18.4% 5% 003157 al
Freight
Addition
5% 048992 al
10.6% 15% 011055
0.0% 8% 002083
16.8% 8% 002084
24.8% 8% 002085
20.7% 8% 002086
20.6% 8% 002087
0.0% 8% 019059 bx/30
0.0% 10% 003331
23.6% 5% 010253
11.7% 5% 010254
11.7% 5% 017482
11.7% 5% 000434




11.7% 5% 000435
11.7% 5% 000436

16.7% 5% 000437

29.4% 8% 012182

20.6% 17% 007319

20.3% 17% 007322

21.9% 12% 002987

28.1% 12% 002988

28.1% 12% 002989

28.1% 12% 002990

28.1% 15% 021538

16.8% 15% 021539

28.6% 15% 021540

28.6% 15% 021541

0.0% 15% 021542

27.8% 15% 021543

16.7% 5% 001052

10.8% 10% 033896

29.4% 10% 029249

29.4% 10% 029248

29.4% 10% 029247

29.4% 10% 029266

29.4% 10% 029253

29.4% 10% 029255

10.7% 6% 003059

Freight
Addition

10.7% 5% 003046 al

10.7% 15% 032692

10.7% 15% 031477

10.7% 15% 012046 |
10.% S
10.7% 15% 025107 |
10.7% 8% 003460

16.9% 8% 003456

0.0% 8% 034785

16.7% 15% 003474

16.7% 10% 014575

20.5% 10% 003236




5%

003458

20.1% 5% 005866
22.6% 5% 005383
16.8% 5% 003256
10.7%
10.8% 0% 002460
20.7% 10% 050606
20.6% 10% 050605
17.9% 10% 050603
14.3% 10% 050602
30.5% 5% 039853
private
20.7% 10% 039221 label
private
10% 039220 label
private
0.0% 10% 039219 label
NOT
AVAILA
11.8% 0% 009851 BLE
11.8% 0% 002477
11.8% 8% 016450
NOT
AVAILA
11.8% 0% 009861 BLE
0.0% 0% 002488
17.1% 10% 050609
11.1% 0% 042931
0.0% no bid |
NA I |
Freight
Addition
5.2% 0% 003912 al
Freight
Addition
19.1% 5% 017596 al




Freight

Addition
0.0% 0% 019935 al
4.9% 5% 000386
Freight
Addition
10.6% 5% 017881 al
Freight
Addition
0.0% 5% 017605 al
Freight
Addition
17.2% 5% 017586 al
need
no bid more info
Freight
Addition
10.7% 0% 017885 al |
00% .
NA 0% 039172 |
16.7% 5% 005455
0.0% 5% 005161
0.0% 15% 037856
0.0% 10% 004622
0.0% 10% 001209
20.7% 10% 004623
I 0% [ooosse
Freight
Addition
16.7% 5% 032202 al
0.0% 5% 001937
0.0% 5% 005578
0.0% 5% 016937 |
20.7% I |
20.7% 5% 033133
20.6% 5% 012357
20.6% 5% 012353
0.0% 5% 015522
16.7% 5% 012347
4.8% 5% 012346
21.0% 5% 012349
I 5% 012334
28.6% 5% 012337
28.6% 5% 041874




28.6% 5% 015520
28.6% 5% 015523
28.6% 5% 003220
28.6% 10% 037598
28.6% 5% 012343 |
0.0% IR
28.6% 4% 012186 gallon |
28.6% 10% 020692

20z
28.6% 20% 032918 cs/132
28.6% 20% 032919 cs/132
28.6% 5% 012340
28.6% 12% 055479
0.0% 15% 037756

Addition

0% 036280 al fgt

0.0% no bid
16.5% 10% 032461
20.7% 8% 012849
20.6% 8% 012850

Addition
0.0% 10% 038027 al fgt
14.3% 5% 055482
20.7% 5% 055481
23.3% 12% 006901 2000s
0.0% 6% 001410
16.8% 17% 003263 1000s
10.2% 6% 009674
9.1% 6% 009675
5.0% 6% 009676
28.9% 6% 009677
16.6% 6% 009678
34.1% 6% 009679
11.8% 6% 009680
29.8% 4% 000924
28.4% 5% 038957
28.9% 10% 000114
28.8% 8% 001436 200's
29.1% 17% 029465 bx/12
27.5% 17% 029466 bx/12
27.9% 8% 001406 bx/12
25.5% 15% 008819 bx/12
16.8% 10% 004729 bx/12




10.8% 10% 002522
14.3% 15% 003145
41.4% no bid
41.2% 15% 003147
41.2% 15% 003148
42.3% 15% 003149
NA 15% 003150
17.0% 12% 000292
16.7% 0% 012912
0.0% 0% 010888
20.7% 10% 001397
0.0% 8% 003800
0.0% 0% 000790
0.0% 8% 000978
0.0% 20% 024212 cs/355
16.7% 20% 038962
0.0% 10% 012747
NA 10% 004018
11.6% 10% 039179
11.0% 5% 000914
0.0% 5% 004239 8qt
10.7% 8% 002045 pk/12
0.0% 10% 001222
0.0% 10% 001223
30.3% 5% 049886 2000's
29.2% 5% 001543
10.8% 12% 009178
7.0% 10% 000302 50yd
10.6% 10% 002969
11.3% 10% 002970
20.9% 10% 002971
20.8% 10% 002973
29.5% 10% 002974
10.6% 10% 015975
0.0% 10% 004637
17.6% 10% 047922
17.7% 10% 039185
17.7% 10% 002095
17.7% 8% 039542
29.5% 10% 012695
17.3% 10% 003366 pk/6
20.7% 5% 012177 bx/18
20.7% 5% 006245 bx/24




28.6% 8% 049822
11.7% 8% 001419
0.0% 10% 016607
subj to
21.6% 0% 009779 change
20.7% 10% 003368 bg/24
0.0% 10% 019940 bg/6 |
18.0% o .
17.5% 24% 029470
11.0% 24% 029474
0.0% 24% 029477
NA 24% 029483
0.0% 5% 015438
0.0% 5% 012569
0.0% 15% 010389
I o
17.8% 5% 012810
17.8% 5% 012808
17.8% 5% 012814
17.8% 5% 009943
15.6% 5% 019728
11.6% 12% 009960
11.8% 12% 009959 |
Addition
5.9% 0% 049270 al fgt
5.9% 0% 034461
5.9% 0% 035069
18.7% 0% 044173
5.9% 12% 012186 gallon
11.7% 15% 017979




11.7% 15% 038723 pk/12
O e TR (P

5.0% 15% 025087

5.0% 15% 037703

5.0% 10% 003460

5.0% 10% 003456

10.7% 10% 003458

16.7% 12% 042930

16.7% 8% 002521

34.5% 8% 002522
500s;

20.1% 5% 044170 plus fgt
500s;

29.8% 5% 044001 plus fgt

22.6% 5% 005866

16.8% 24% 029470

17.9% 24% 029480

8.7% 24% 029479

29.7% 24% 029483

16.7% 5% 015543

0.0% 0% 012006

0.0% 0%

14.3% 5% 004238

17.8% 5% 004239

11.7% 5% 004240

17.8% 15% 007323

17.8% 24% 029504

0.0% 24% 029503

0.0% 20% 029487

10.8% 5% 009943

10.5% 20% 029507

10.6% 5% 012695

10.7% 0% 036874

28.6% 0% 025020

17.8%
Merck

17.8% 50% off LIST (022339 shelter
Merck

17.7% 48% off LIST (011276 shelter
Merck

17.7% 49% off LIST [038883 shelter




Merck

20.1% 48% off LIST 006882 shelter
Merck
20.7% 49% off LIST 009456 shelter
Merck
2.4% 52% off LIST 011543 shelter
Merck
0.0% 52% off LIST 011540 shelter
I
50.4% 0% 043645 6X6
48.5% 0% 043640 6x6
49.3% 0% 043641 6X6
48.6% 0% 043643 6X6
51.2% 0% 043644 6x6
52.1% 0% 043637 6x6
52.2% 0% 043636 6X6
0% 041064 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 041065 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 021244 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 021246 change
subj to
0.0% 0% 021245 change
Merck
0.0% 20% 035468 shelter
Merck
0.0% 20% 035469 shelter
Merck
0.0% 20% 035470 shelter
with
shelter
agreemen
0.0% 20% 035364 t
with
shelter
agreemen
0.0% 20% 050168 t
with
shelter
agreemen
0.0% 20% 035363 t




with

shelter
agreemen

0.0% 20% 035362 t
with
shelter
agreemen

0.0% 20% 050368 t
with
shelter
agreemen

20.1% 20% 035375 t
with
shelter
agreemen

20.1% 20% 035374 t

20.0% 0% varies by item

0.0% 0.0%

0.0% 0.0%

0.0% 0.0%

0.0% 0.0%

0.0% 0.0%

0.0% 0.0%

0.0% 0.0%

0.0% varies by item 0.0% varies by item
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NON RESPONSIVE

VET CLINIC SUPPLY STOCK Vendor: Midwest Vet Henry Schein Animal Health
BID SHEET ~ RFB # 15147 Contact: Julie Burrell Beth Seeley/Casey Perkins
. . . Email: Julie.burrell@midwestvet.net biddesk@henryscheinvet.com
The annual estimated dollar value of this contract shall be $150,000. Annual estimated - 0
quantities are not known and vary from year to year. Phone: 952-894-4350 800-282-5162 x5532
City/State: Lakerville, MN Dublin, OH 43017
CORE LIST PRICES GOOD FOR 12
MONTHS EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM GENERIC AVAIL DESC. QTY UOM PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Antibiotics
Cephalexin 250mg Capsules OR EQUAL 500ct bottle 1 BO $ 2398 | $ 2398 | $ 3320 [ $ 33.20 [[subj to change
Cephalexin 500mg Capsules OR EQUAL 500ct bottle 1 BO $ 34.36 | $ 3436 | $ 4450 | $ 44,50 [[subj to change
Clavamox Drops 15ml bottle OR EQUAL 15ml bottle 15 BO $ 157.20 | $ 2,358.00 || $ 1310 | $ 196.50 [[subj to change
Clavamox 62.5mg Tablets OR EQUAL 210ct box 10 BX $ 7950 | $ 795.00 || $ 79.50 | $ 795.00 (|subj to change
Clavamox 125mg Tablets OR EQUAL 210ct box 10 BX $ 14730 | $ 1,473.00 || $ 14730 | $ 1,473.00 [[subj to change
Clavamox 250mg Tablets OR EQUAL 210ct box 10 BX $ 24255 | $ 2,42550 || $ 24255 | $ 2,425.50 [|subj to change
Clavamox 375mg Tablets OR EQUAL 210ct box 10 BX $ 346.60 | $ 3,466.00 || $ 346.60 | $ 3,466.00 [|subj to change
Clindamycin 75mg Tablets or Capsules OR EQUAL 200ct bottle 2 BO $ 62.09 [ $ 12418 || $ 6244 | $ 124.88 |[subj to change
Clindamycin 150mg Tablets or Capsules OR EQUAL 100ct bottle 2 BO $ 7771 % 1554 | $ 958 | $ 19.16 [|subj to change
Clindamycin Drops 25mg/ml OR EQUAL 20m| bottle 5 BO $ 2791 $ 1395 | $ 3.00 | $ 15.00 [|subj to change
Pain
Carprofen 25mg Tablets OR EQUAL 180ct bottle 10 BO $ 13230 | $ 1,323.00 | $ 12390 | $ 1,239.00 (|subj to change
Carprofen 75mg Tablets OR EQUAL 180ct bottle 5 BO [$ 162.30 | $ 81150 (| $ 152.70 | $ 763.50 [|subj to change
Carprofen 100mg Tablets OR EQUAL 180ct bottle 5 BO $ 191.70 | $ 958.50 || $ 187.80 | $ 939.00 rSubj to change
Meloxicam Oral Suspension 0.5mg/ml Metacam; subj
OR generic / equiva’ient ’ OR EQUAL Soml bottle 5 BO |$ 244 | $ 112.20 | $ 2820 | $ 141.00 [lto change
Meloxicam Oral Suspension 1.5mg/ml
OR generic / equiva’ient ’ OR EQUAL 100mt bottte 5 BO |$ 4785 | $ 239.25 | $ 5150 | $ 257.50 |Meloxidyl;
Dewormers
Pyrantel Pamoate OR EQUAL 320z hottle 2 BO [$ 1764 | $ 3528 | $ 2440 | $ 48.80 [[subj to change
Injectables
Carprofen (50mg/ml) OR EQUAL 20ml bottle 15 BO $ 104.65 | $ 1,569.75 || $ 104.65 | $ 1,569.75 [|subj to change
Meloxicam or Meloxidyl OR EQUAL 10ml bottle 5 BO $ 4809 | $ 24045 | 6472 | 8 323.60 tEoI(():)r(]g?\;té subj
Penicillin G OR EQUAL 250ml bottle 5 BO $ 7731 $ 38.65 | $ 872 $ 43.60 |[subj to change
Praziquantel 56.8mg/ml OR EQUAL 50ml bottle 5 BO $ 264.20 | $ 1,321.00 | $ 28111 | $ 1,405.55 [|subj to change
. Anased; subj
Xylazine 100mg/ml OR EQUAL Somi bottle 2 BO |$ 1089 | $ 3078 | $ 2242 | $ 44.84 |Jto change
Controlled Drugs
Butorphanol 10mg/ml OR EQUAL 2.5 mL bottle 3 BO $ 3420 [ $ 102.60 | $ 56.28 | $ 168.84 |[subj to change
Ketamine 100mg/ml OR EQUAL 10ml bottle 24.25 ||subj to change

Anesthesia
Baralyme / Sodalime 37Ib. OR EQUAL 37 Ib bag 2 185.70
Isoflurane OR EQUAL 250ml bottle 10 BO $ 2381 [ $ 238.10 | $ 22.00 | $ 220.00 [subj to change
Surgery
Suture, Monofilament Absorbable OR EQUAL #0 25 BX $ 7851 [ $ 1,962.75| $ 7592 [ $ 1,898.00
Suture, Monofilament Absorbable OR EQUAL size 2-0 200 BX |$ 7154 | $ 14,308.00 || $ 62.00 | $ 12,400.00
Suture, Monofilament Absorbable OR EQUAL size 3-0 50 BX $ 60.00 | $ 3,000.00 || $ 51.94 | $ 2,597.00
Miscellaneous Items - r— —r—r—r— 1+ | 7’/ ] "7
Chlorhexidine Scrub OR EQUAL 1 gallon 3 BO $ 1458 | $ 4374 | $ 2095 [ $ 62.85
Chlorhexidine Solution OR EQUAL 1 gallon 3 BO $ 631 ] $ 1893 | $ 8.02 | $ 24.06
Syringe Caps- Luer Slip OR EQUAL 100 ct 3 BX $ 6.04 | $ 18.12 | $ 8.01 [ $ 24.03
Shelter - r——r—r—r 5]
plus freight
Accel Concentrate NO sUBS 55 gallon ! EA | s 133047 |$  133047|$ 155850 | $  1.558.50 [$158
Accel Concentrate NO SUBS 5 gallon 10 EA $ 14398 | $ 1,439.80 | $ 15155 | $ 1,515.50
Accel RTU NO SUBS 32 0z bottle 10 EA | $ 858 | $ 85.80 | $ 9.03 | $ 90.30
Accel Wipes NO SUBS 160 count 15 EA $ 1460 | $ 219.00 (| $ 1537 | $ 230.55
Needles OR EQUAL 189 3 BX $ 345 | $ 1035 | $ 3.00 | $ 9.00
Needles OR EQUAL 22gx11/2" 5 BX $ 566 | $ 28.30 | $ 315 [ $ 15.75
Needles OR EQUAL 22gx1" 3 BX $ 3451 % 1035 | $ 3.00 | $ 9.00
Needles OR EQUAL 259 x 5/8" 20 BX $ 345 $ 69.00 | $ 3.00 [ $ 60.00
Pancreas Powder Plus OR EQUAL 12 oz. 1 EA $ 9599 | $ 9599 || $ 9522 | $ 95.22
Pyrantel Pamoate OR EQUAL 320z hottle 3 BO $ 1764 | $ 5292 (| $ 2440 [ $ 73.20
Syringes 1ml w/ 25g x 5/8" Needle OR EQUAL 100/box 5 BX $ 8.67 | $ 4335 $ 890 | $ 44.50
Syringes 1ml w/o Needle OR EQUAL 100/box 5 BX $ 741 $ 37.05( $ 775 $ 38.75
Syringes 3ml w/ 22g x 1" Needle OR EQUAL 100/box 5 BX $ 6.01 | $ 30.05 | $ 6.20 | $ 31.00
Syringes 3ml 22x3/4 LS VPAK OR EQUAL 100/box 5 BX $ 6.01[$ 30.05 [ $ 1170 | $ 58.50
Syringes 5ml no needle OR EQUAL 100/box 5 BX $ 9.78 | $ 48.90 || $ 8.46 | $ 42.30
Vaccines
Bordatella Vaccine OR EQUAL 25 x 1 dose 100 EA $ 63.25 | $ 6,325.00 || $ 63.25 | $ 6,325.00 ||Merck shelter
DA2PP Vaccine OR EQUAL 25 x 1 dose 100 EA $ 62.50 | $ 6,250.00 || $ 62.50 | $ 6,250.00 ||Merck shelter
DA2PPL Vaccine OR EQUAL 25 x 1 dose 100 EA [ 90.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 9,000.00 |[Merck shelter
FVRCP Vaccine OR EQUAL 25 x 1 dose 100 EA $ 52.00 | $ 5,200.00 || $ 52.00 | $ 5,200.00 ||Merck shelter
FVRCP & FELV vaccine OR EQUAL 25 x 1 dose 100 EA [$ 14575 | § 14,575.00 || $ 14575 | § 14,575.00 [[Merck shelter
Rabies Vaccine - 1-year OR EQUAL 5 x 10 dose 100 EA | $ 5150 | $ 5,150.00 || $ 5150 | $ 5,150.00 [[Merck shelter
Rabies Vaccine - 3-year OR EQUAL 5 x 10 dose 20 EA | $ 55.00 | $ 1,100.00 || $ 55.00 | $ 1,100.00 [[Merck shelter
TOTAL CORE ITEMS $ 88,451.49 $ 84,445.68
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