Main Library Remodel 2015-2016

EXPENSE CATEGORIES DESCRIPTION OF EXPENSE AMOUNT Actual
Cultural Surroundings Library Signage 22,400.00 22,400.00
Intelligent Interiors Library General Furnishings 108,691.00 108,690.42
Adagio One Library Furniture 168,124.00 168,124.00
Southern Aluminum 20 Tables 5,886.00 5,885.72
GL Seaman & Company Seating Sit on It 4,254.00 4,253.62
GL Seaman & Company Library Furniture Nevins 13,052.00 13,051.26
GL Seaman & Company Knoll Studio 14,693.00 14,692.40
GL Seaman & Company Cortona Lounge Chair 7,561.00 7,560.28
GL Seaman & Company Davis Furniture 27,248.00 27,247.25
GL Seaman & Company Dauphin Furniture 9,100.00 9,099.04
GL Seaman & Company COM Fabrics 8,135.00 8,134.13
GL Seaman & Company Campbell Contract 5,887.00 5,886.69
GL Seaman & Company ALLSEATING 11,552.00 11,551.67
GL Seaman & Company Agati 9,321.00 9,320.40
GL Seaman & Company Clarus 11,321.00 11,320.81
GL Seaman & Company Knoll 5,731.00 5,730.86
GL Seaman & Company Lowenstein 10,162.00 10,161.20
Cultural Surroundings End Stacks 3,277.00 3,277.00
Cultural Surroundings Shelving 247,567.00 247,566.85
DIRTT by GL Seaman & Company DIRTT Walls 149,902.00 149,901.88
Libra-Tech Library Furniture 98,525.00 98,525.00
Contrax Furnishings 54,905.00 54,904.30
Contrax Children's Chair 1,203.00 1,202.92
TOTAL PROJECT/PROGRAM BUDGET REQUESTED 998,497.00 998,487.70




Adagio One, Inc Cultural FastSigns GL Seaman Intelligent Interiors, Inc.
City of Grand Prairie Thomas Rabe Paula Wenstrom Alex Garcia Francie Wintermute Lindy Heath
GP Library Furnishings Largo, FL. Dallas, TX Dallas, TX Fort Worth, TX Addison, TX
Bid Tabulation - RFB # 16016 727-530-3457 214-742-2400 214-467-8200 817-336-5400 972-716-9979
‘adagiolinc. @gmail.com paula@culturalsurroundings.com alex.g@fastsigns.com fwintermute@glsc.com intelli fors.net
Iteml Description Qty | Unit Price Extended Price Qty | Unit Price Extended Price Qty | Unit Price Extended Price Qty | Unit Price Extended Price Qty | Unit Price Extended Price
[Section I General Furnishings [Nosi0) No BID) NoBID
1 [Bench BEO1 4 193.90 77560 | 4 193.90 775.60
2 ip! existing lounge chair EXLCO8 4 705.09 2,820.36 | 4 54132 2,165.29
3 ip! existing ottoman EXOMO01 2 288.02 576.04 | 2 54132 1,082.64
4 |Greet Station GS01 1 9,209.08 9,209.08 | 1 9,209.12 9,209.12
5 |Lounge chair LCO1 4 122878 491512 | 4 122878 4,915.12
6 |Lounge chair LCO2 2 925.67 185134| 2 1851.22 3,702.44
7_|Lounge chair LCO3 6 131049 7,862.94 | 6 131049 7,862.94
8 |Occasional table OTO1 3 1,178.05 353415 3 1,178.05 3,534.15
9 [Occasional table OT02 4 793.66 3,17464 | 4 793.66 3,174.64
10 [Occasional table OT03 2 922.93 184586 | 2 922.20 1,844.40
11 [Occasional table OT04 4 522.44 2,089.76 | 4 522.44 2,089.76
12 [Round reading table TBO1 2 2,459.63 4,919.26 | 2 2,459.63 4,919.26
13 |Round reading table TB02 2 2,459.63 491926 | 2 2,459.63 4,919.26
| 14 |Benching computer table TBO7 2 25,520.84 51,041.68 | 2 24,054.05 48,108.10
Sub-total $ 99,535.09 $ 98,302.72
Installation $ 5,382.48 $ 4,170.43
Insurance upon award $ 1,000.00
Bond cashiers check See bid
Freight $ 6,708.25 $ 5,217.27
Section Total $ - $ - $ - $ 111,625.82 $ 108,690.42
|Section 1 Signage [NO BID|
1 |Sign holder SI01 100 114.00 11,400.00 | 100 15715 | $ 15,715.00 [NO BID| NO BID|
2 [Graphic Insert S102 50 45.00 2,250.00 | 50 66.95 | $ 3,347.50
3 [Graphic Insert SI03 50 45.00 2,250.00 | 50 9090 | $ 4,545.00
4 |Graphic Insert S104 50 45.00 2,250.00 | 50 12590 | $ 6,295.00
5 _|Graphic Insert SI05 50 45.00 2,250.00 | 50 17380 | $ 8,690.00
Sub-total $ 20,400.00 $ 38,592.50
Installation $ 2,000.00 $ -
Bond included $ 600.00
Freight included $ 200.00
Section Total $ - $ 22,400.00 $ 39,392.50 $ - $ -
|Section 111 Library Furniture
1 [Canopy Top CT01 6 592,00 | $ 3,552.00 | 6 761.00 4,566.00 |NO BID| INO BID)| 6 402.35 2,414.10
2 [Canopy Top CT02 1 1,580.00 | $ 158000 | 1 1,877.00 1,877.00 1 1,294.12 1,294.12
3 [Canopy Top CT03 2 3,140.00 6,280.00 | 5 1,275.00 6,375.00 2 1134.12 2,268.24
4 |Canopy Top CT04 1 7,420.00 742000 | 2 655.00 1,310.00 1 7,185.88 7,185.88
5 [Display table DS04 2 3,375.00 6,750.00 | 2 6,555.00 13,110.00 0 - -
6 _|End panel EPO1 718 870.00 6,090.00 | 7 913.00 6,391.00 7 429.41 3,005.87
7_|End panel EP02 6 |$ 147200 8,832.00 | 6 1,407.00 8,442.00 6 1,117.65 6,705.90
8 |End panel EPO3 61 | $ 418.00 | $ 25,498.00 | 61 489.00 29,829.00 61 482.35 29,423.35
9 |End panel EPO4 6 |8 31300 | $ 187800| 6 286.00 1,716.00 6 382.35 2,294.10
10 |End panel EPOS 2 |$ 222800|$ 4,456.00 | 2 1921.00 3,842.00 2 2/411.76 4,823.52
11 |End panel EPO6 17 |8 705.00 | $ 11,985.00 | 17 1,203.00 20,451.00 17 182353 31,000.01
12 |End panel EPO7 4 1S 29300 | $ 117200| 4 261.00 1,044.00 4 288.24 1,152.96
13 |End panel EP08 6 |$ 408.00 | $ 2,44800 | 6 476.00 2,856.00 6 682.35 4,094.10
14 |End panel EPO9 6 |$ 705.00 | $ 4,23000 | 6 1,608.00 9,648.00 6 2,294.12 13,764.72
15 |End panel EP10 4 13 37000 | $ 148000 | 4 319.00 1,276.00 4 229.41 917.64
16 |End panel EP11 6 |$ 30300 | $ 181800| 6 351.00 2,106.00 6 400.00 2,400.00
17 |Existing end panel EXEP12 4 13 84300 | $ 337200 | 4 195.00 780.00 4 452.94 1811.76
18 |Existing end panel EXEP13 4 13 682.00 | $ 2,72800 | 4 270.00 1,080.00 4 664.71 2,658.84
19 |End panel EP14 2 |$ 312700|$ 6,254.00 | 2 2,770.00 5,540.00 2 2,352.94 4,705.88
20 |End panel EP15 1 |$ 379200]$ 379200 | 1 4,196.00 4,196.00 1 2,094.12 2,094.12
21 |End panel EP16 2 488.00 976.00 | 2 489.00 978.00 2 694.12 1,388.24
22 |End panel EP17 2 870.00 174000 | 2 610.00 1,020.00 2 688.25 137650
23 [Existing PAC carrel EXPCO1 4 675.00 270000 | 4 585.00 2,340.00 4 1,828.24 7,312.96
xisting PAC carrel EXPC02 1 851.00 85100 1 650.00 650.00 1 1828.24 182824
25 [Existing reading table EXRTOL 4 2,940.00 11,76000 | 4 2,777.00 11,108.00 4 2,805.88 11,223.52
26 |Existing reading table EXRT02 4 2,940.00 11,76000 | 4 2,777.00 11,108.00 4 2,805.88 11,223.52
27 [Existing university carrel EXUC01 6 3,287.00 19,72200 | 6 3,221.00 19,326.00 6 3,294.12 19,764.72
]Surz-total $ 161,124.00 $ 173,165.00 $ 178,132.81
Installation included included $ 10,000.00
Insurance included included
Bond $ 4,800.00 included
Freight $ 2,200.00 included $ -
Section Total $ 168,124.00 $ 173,165.00 $ - $ - $ 188,132.81
|Grand Total $ 168,124.00 $ 195,565.00 $ 39,392.50 $ 111,625.82 $ 296,823.23




